CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 001-15 12/16/2014 TIME: 10:00 A.M.
BWI Winfield Harrell's John Deere Turf Care of Texas
Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product
FUNGICIDES
Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. no bid As Specified | $  181.00 | As Specified | $  208.94 | As Specified | $ 210.34 | As Specified | $ 150.80 | mycozoen
Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $  185.00 | As Specified | $  185.00 | As Specified | $ 185.00 | As Specified | $ 185.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
Heritage TL 6 gal. 1gal. $  509.00 | As Specified | $ 509.00 | As Specified | $  509.00 | As Specified | $ 509.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
HERBICIDES
1 |Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 56.90 pedge Hamme| $ 80.80 | Prosedge2 | $ 61.94 | Sedge Ham | $ 62.85 | Sledghammer | $ 97.50
2 |Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 | As Specified | $ 2,740.00 | As Specified | $ 2,740.00 | As Specified | $ 2,740.00 | As Specified no bid
3 |Revolver 30 gts. 1qt $  198.95 | As Specified | $  202.25 | As Specified | $  230.94 87 oz btl $ 239.44 | As Specified No Bid
4 |Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1gal. $ 142.00 $  142.00 | As Specified | $ 142.00 | As Specified | $ 142.00 | As Specified | $ 96.20 | prodiamine 4l
1500 grams |25 gram box $  215.00 | As Specified | $  215.00 | As Specified | $  215.00 | As Specified | $ 240.00 | As Specified no bid
5/6 JMonument Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 399.45| RangerPro | $ 623.70 | As Specified | $  995.00 | As Specified | $ 523.86 | Presecutor $ 586.00 glystar
Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $  499.50 | As Specified | $  480.13 | As Specified | $  588.94 | As Specified | $ 538.73 | As Specified no bid
Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $  103.40 | As Specified | $  113.60 | As Specified | $ 134.94 | As Specified | $ 127.46 | As Specified | $ 59.80 oryzalin
Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 77.25 2.5 gal $ 82.45 2.5 gal $ 87.94 2.5 gal $ 73.26 2.5 gal $ 44.20 per 1 gal
10 [Specticle Flo 15 gal 1 gal. $ 1,544.00 | As Specified | $ 1,544.00 | As Specified | $ 1,544.00 | As Specified | $ 1,544.00 | As Specified no bid
INSECTICIDES
1 |Provant 20 100z. Btls |10 oz. bottle $ 66.50 | As Specified | $ 57.80 | As Specified | $ 89.83 No Bid $ 74.82 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 122.00 | As Specified | $  128.31 | As Specified | $ 139.94 No Bid $ 146.06 Scimitor No Bid
Advion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag $ 118.72 | As Specified | $ 260.99 25# bag $ 273.94 No Bid $ 307.20 25# bag No Bid No Bid
Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag $ 225.00 | As Specified | $ 239.14 No Bid $ 259.94 No Bid $ 297.65 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
OTHER
K-Mag 10 ton 50Ib. $ 15.25 | As Specified | $ 15.00 | As Specified | $ 20.95 No Bid $ 22.25 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal $ 2,813.25| Aqueduct | $ 3,874.20 | As Specified | $ 1,365.00 | Hydo Cure [ $ 837.54 lesco $ 3,800.00 retain
12-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated
3 [Im.+2% Mn 500 gal. 2.50r 30 gal $10.56/gal | As Specified | $10.05/gal No Bid $9.16/gal 15-0-0 $12.41/gal |55 gal see bid $40/gl 270 gal tote




CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION

"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 001-15 12/16/2014 TIME: 10:00 A.M.
Turf & Soil Management llc Justin Seed Koemel Fertilizer Green Resource LLC
Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product
FUNGICIDES
1 |Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 198.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 135.29 Myclobut
2 |Daconil Zn 15 gal. 2.5gal. $ 195.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 185.00 | As Specified
3 [|Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 515.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 509.00 | As Specified
HERBICIDES
1 |Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 61.00 | Prosedge no bid no bid $ 64.35 | Sedghammer
2 |Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,790.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 2,740.00 | As Specified
3 |Revolver 30 gts. 1qt $ 219.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 214.98 | As Specified
4 |Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. no bid no bid no bid $ 142.00 | As Specified
1500 grams |25 gram box $ 219.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 240.00 | As Specified
5/6 |Monument Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 1,000.00 | Ranger Pro no bid no bid $ 529.00 Ranger
7 |Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 580.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 522.96 | As Specified
8 [Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 118.00 | As Specified no bid no bid $ 92.63 oryzdlin
9 [Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 90.00 Pin-Dec no bid no bid $ 80.00 | As Specified
10 |Specticle Flo 15 gal 1 gal. no bid no bid no bid $ 1,544.00 | As Specified
INSECTICIDES
1 |Provant 20 100z. Btls |10 oz. bottle $ 70.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid $ 87.35 | As Specified
2 |Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 131.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid $ 79.80 lamoda
3 JAdvion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag $ 260.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid $ 279.50 25# bag
4 JAward Fire Ant 50# 25# bag no bid No Bid No Bid $ 264.70 | As Specified
OTHER
1 ]K-Mag 10 ton 50Ib. $ 14.00 | As Specified | $ 15.23 | As Specified No Bid $ 30.50 | As Specified
2 |TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal no bid No Bid No Bid 1528.4/20gal magnus
12-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated
3 |Im.+2% Mn 500 gal. 2.5 0r 30 gal $10/gal 10-0-0 No Bid $  20.00 $ 4275 | ferromec
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