CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION

"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 005-20 4/8/2020
:Award to Target Specialty Products Harrell's LLC
| Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1 |Headway 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 438.00 | Agency priced |10 gal. 1gal. $ 438.00 Agency priced
2 |Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 202.50 | Agency priced |15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 202.50 Agency priced
3 |Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 530.00 [ Agency priced |6 gal. 1 gal. $ 530.00 Agency priced
4 |Prostar 70 WG 30 bottles 3 Ib bottle $ 174.00 30 bottles 3 Ib bottle $ 199.68
HERBICIDES
1 |Prosedge or equivalent 30 bottles 1.3 0z.bottles | $ 54.50 30 bottles 1.3 0z. bottles | $ 67.95
2 |Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal drum $ 595.00 90 gal. 30 gal drum no bid
3 |Primo Link Pak 20 gal 10 gal $ 2,740.00 | Agency priced |20 gal 10 gal $ 2,740.00 Agency priced
4 |Revolver 20 gts 1 qt $ 257.00 20 gts 1qt $ 306.11
5 |Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 | Agency priced |50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 Agency priced
6 |Monument 1000 grams |25 gram box no bid 1000 grams |25 gram box $ 250.00 Agency priced
7 |Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 538.75 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 538.75
8 |surflan AS 30 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid 30 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid
9 |Pendimethalin (Liquid) 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 70.00 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 101.60
10 |Speciticle Flo* 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,700.00 | Agency priced |15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,700.00 Agency priced
11 |Trimec Southern 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 159.00 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 67.30 | SUB/GENERIC
INSECTICIDES
1 |Provant 20 120z. Btls|12 oz. bottle $ 103.00 20 120z. Btls |12 oz. bottle $ 118.00
2 |Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 164.00 8 quarts Qt. $ 189.97
3 |TopChoice 500# 50# bag $ 139.000 | Agency priced |500# 50# bag $ 139.00 Agency priced
4 |Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag no bid 50# 25# bag $ 312.00
OTHER
1 |K-Mag 5 ton 50Ib. $ 15.25 | 3 ton minimum |5 ton 50Ib. no bid
2 |TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 30 gals $ 555.00 | SUB/GENERIC 165 gal. 55 gal. $ 2,942.00 | SUB/GENERIC
3 |Harrells Max Iron MNMG 250 gal. 30 gals $ 552.3500 [ SUB/GENERIC ]250 gal. 30 gal $ 406.87 spec
4 |Harrells Max 4-0-8 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 56.50 [ SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal $ 37.80 spec
5 |Harrells Max 4-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 24.00| SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal $ 130.00 spec
6 |Harrells Max 18-3-6 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 41.00 [ SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal $ 53.70 spec
7 |Harrells Max 12-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 26.00 | SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal $ 39.70 spec
8 |Harrells Max 6-0-0 50 gal 3# $ 11.0000| SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal $ 68.54 spec
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10 |Harrels EarthMax 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 57.5000 [ SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal $ 86.80 spec
11 |Simplot 4-0-1 Trident 100 gal 2.5 gal $ 48.4500 | SUB/GENERIC |100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
12 |simplot 12-2-12 super K 100 gal 2.5 gal $ 45,0000 | SUB/GENERIC [100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
13 |Simplot Duraphite 12 2%%MN 12%K 100 gal 2.5 gal $ 114.7500 | SUB/GENERIC |100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
14 |Simplot 3-30-3 ecopower 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 90.0000 [ SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
15 |Simplot 0-4-6 biokelp 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 48.4500 | SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
16 |Simplot 12-0-0 Fe plus 3%MN 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 26.0000 [ SUB/GENERIC |50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
17 |Simplot Biophase SBE 100 gal 2.5 gal $ 108.0000 | SUB/GENERIC |100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
18 |Simplot Rapture 4-0-4 300 Ibs 100 Ib case $ 112.0000 | SUB/GENERIC ]300 Ibs 100 Ib case no bid
CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"
BID NUMBER: 005-20 4/8/2020
:Award to Helena Agri Enterprises LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1 |Headway 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 438.00 | Agency priced |10 gal. 1 gal. $ 438.00 Agency priced
2 |Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 202.50 | Agency priced |15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 202.50 Agency priced
3 |Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 495.00 | SUB/GENERIC |6 gal. 1 gal. $ 530.00 Agency priced
4 |Prostar 70 WG 30 hottles 3 Ib bottle $ 195.00 30 bottles 3 |b bottle $ 231.65
HERBICIDES
1 |Prosedge or equivalent 30 bottles  [1.3 0z. bottles | $ 58.46 30 bottles 1.3 0z. bottles | $ 58.68
2 |Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal drum $ 375.00 | SUB/GENERIC |90 gal. 30 gal drum $ 414,60 | SUB/GENERIC
3 |Primo Link Pack 20 gal 10 gal $ 2,740.00 | Agency priced |20 gal 10 gal $ 2,740.00 | Agency priced
4 |Revolver 20 gts 1qt $ 235.00 20 gts 1qt $ 282.84
5 |Barricade 4| 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 75.00 | SUB/GENERIC |50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 | Agency priced
6 |Monument 1000 grams |25 gram box $ 225.00 [ Agency priced ]1000 grams |25 gram box $ 250.00 Agency priced
7 [Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 538.75 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 53875
8 [Surflan AS 30 gal. 25 gal. no bid 30 gal. 25 gal. $  70.95| SUBIGENERIC
9 |Pendimethalin (Liquid) 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 100.00 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 70.95
10 |Specticle Flo 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,550.00  Ageny priced |15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,700.00 | Agency priced
11 |Trimec Southern 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 150.00 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 166.08
INSECTICIDES
1|Provant 20 120z. Btls |12 oz. bottle $ 85.20 20 120z. Btls |12 oz bottle $ 109.16
2|Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 155.68 8 quarts Qt. $ 175.53
3] TopChoice 500# 50# bag $ 139.00 Agency priced  |500# 50# bag $ 139.00 Agency priced
4|Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag $ 175.00 Pro Bait 50# 25# bag $ 378.40
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OTHER
1]K-Mag 5 ton 50Ib. $ 13.50 5 ton 50Ib. $ 28.61
2| TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal 165 gal. 55 gal. no bid
3]Harrells Max Iron MNMG 250 gal. 30 gal. 250 gal. 50 gal no bid
4|Harrells Max 4-0-8 50 gal 2.5gal 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
5]Harrells Max4-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
6]Harrells Max 18-3-6 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 27.64 SUB/GENERIC
7|Harrells Max 12-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 16.70 SUB/GENERIC
8|Harrells Max 6-0-0 50 gal 2.5gal 50 gal 2.5gal no bid
9|Harrels Max 0-0-25 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal $ 29.89 SUB/GENERIC
10]Harrels EarthMax 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
11]Simplot 4-0-1 Trident 100 gal 2.5 gal 100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
12]|Simplot 12-2-12 superkK 100 gal 2.5 gal 100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
13| Simplot Duraphite 12 2%MN 12%K 100 gal 2.5 gal 100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
14]Simplot 3-30-3 ecopower 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
15]Simplot 0-4-6 biokelp 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
16]Simplot 12-0-0 Fe plus 3%MN 50 gal 2.5 gal 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
17]simplot biophase SBE 100 gal 2.5 gal 100 gal 2.5 gal no bid
18]Simplot Rapture 4-0-4 300 Ibs 100 Ib case 300 lbs 100 Ib case no bid
CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"
BID NUMBER: 005-20 4/8/2020
Award to Simplot AB Retail Inc Winfield United
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1 |Headway 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 438.00 | Agency priced |10 gal. 1gal. $ 438.00 Agency priced
2 |Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 202.50 | Agency priced |15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 202.50 Agecy priced
3 |Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 530.00 [ Agency priced |6 gal. 1 gal. $ 530.00 Agecy priced
4 |Prostar 70 WG 30 bottles 3 Ib bottle $ 169.59 30 bottles 3 Ib bottle $ 146.99
HERBICIDES
1 |Prosedge or equivalent 30 bottles 1.3 0z. bottles | $ 45.80 30 bottles 1.3 0z. bottles | $ 55.00
2 |Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal drum $ 523.50 90 gal. 30 gal drum $ 384.90 | SUB/GENERIC
3 |Primo Link Pak 20 gal 10 gal $ 2,740.00 | Agency priced |20 gals 10 gal $ 2,740.00 Agency priced
4 |Revolver 20 gts 1qt $ 220.75 20 gts 1qt $ 241.99
5 |Barricade 4l 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 [ Agency priced |50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 Agency priced
6 |Monument 1000 grams |25 gram box $ 250.00 [ Agency priced ]1000 grams |25 gram box $ 250.00 Agency priced
7 |Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 538.75 30 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 538.75
8 |surflan AS 30 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 115.00 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 150.00
9 |Pendimethalin (Liquid) 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 60.00 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 71.12
10 |specticle Flo 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,700.00 Agency priced |15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,700.00 | Agency priced
11 ITrimec Southern 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 124.75 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 158.83
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INSECTICIDES

1 JProvant 20 120z. Btls|12 oz. bottle $ 381.60 72 0z bottle 20 120z. Btls |12 oz. bottle $ 95.88

2 |Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 136.98 8 quarts Qt. $ 155.00

3 |TopChoice 500# 50# bag $ 139.00 | Agency priced |500# 50# bag $ 139.00 Agency priced

4 |Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag $ 250.05 Advion 50# 25# bag $ 277.89 Advion
OTHER

1 |K-Mag 5 ton 50lb. $ 12.25 5 ton 50Ib. $ 13.13

2 |Tricure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. $ 2,860.00 165 gal. 55 gal. $ 4,015.00

3 |Harrells Max Iron MNMG 250 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid 250 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid

4 |Harrells Max 4-0-8 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid

5 |Harrells Max 4-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid

6 |Harrells Max 18-3-6 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. $ 32.50 | SUB/GENERIC

7 |Harrells Max 12-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. $ 21.88 [ SUB/GENERIC

8 [Harrells Max 6-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid

9 |Harrells Max 0-0-25 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. $ 28.12 SUB/GENERIC

10 |Harrels EarthMax 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. $ 87.50 SUB/GENERIC

11 |Simplot 4-0-1 Trident 100 gal 2.5gal. $90 100 gal 2.5gal. no bid

12 |Simplot 12-2-12 superK 100 gal 2.5gal. $45 100 gal 2.5¢gal. no bid

13 |Simplot Duraphite 12 2%MN 12%K 100 gal 2.5gal. $60 100 gal 2.5 gal. $95 |SUB/GENERIC

14 |Simplot 3-30-3 ecopower 50 gal 2.5 gal. $45 50 gall 2.5 gal. $75 [SUB/GENERIC

15 |Simplot 0-4-6 biokelp 50 gal 2.5¢gal. $70 50 gal 2.5gal. $52.50 |[SUB/GENERIC

16 |Simplot 12-0-0 Fe plus 3%MN 50 gal 2.5¢gal. $30 50 gal 2.5gal. $21.88 |SUB/GENERIC

17 |Simplot Biophase SBE 100 gal 2.5gal. $75 50 gal 2.5gal. $87.50 |SUB/GENERIC

18 |Simplot Rapture 4-0-4 300 Ibs 100 Ib case $190 |50 Ib case 300 Ibs 100 Ib case |no bid
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