
2/21/2019

Award to

Packaging Packaging
FUNGICIDES

1 Headway 10 gal. 1 gal. 417.00$              Agency priced 10 gal. 1 gal. 438.00$         Agency priced
2 Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 200.00$              Agency priced 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 202.50$         Agency priced
3 Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. 509.00$              Agency priced 6 gal. 1 gal. 530.00$         Agency priced

HERBICIDES
1 Prosedge or equivalent 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 53.48$                30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 63.00$           
2 Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal drum 517.35$              90 gal. 30 gal drum 398.07$         SUB/GENERIC
3 Primo Link Pak 20 gal 10 gal 2,740.00$           Agency priced 20 gal 10 gal 2,740.00$      Agency priced
4 Revolver 30 qts 1 qt 234.71$              30 qts 1 qt 253.62$         
5 Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. 137.00$              Agency priced 50 gal. 1 gal. 137.00$         Agency priced
6 Monument 1500 grams 25 gram box 220.00$              Agency priced 1500 grams 25 gram box 225.00$         Agency priced
7 Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 527.66$              50 gal. 2.5 gal. 578.75$         
8 Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 142.00$              50 gal. 2.5 gal. 128.33$         
9 Pendimethalin (Liquid) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. 94.42$                100 gal. 2.5 gal. 97.11$           
10 Specticle Flo* 15 gal. 1 gal. 1,528.00$           Agency priced 15 gal. 1 gal. 1,528.00$      Agency priced

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 12oz. Btls 12 oz. bottle 100.00$              20 12oz. Btls 12 oz. bottle 101.85$         
2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. 156.14$              8 quarts Qt. 156.00$         
3 TopChoice 500# 50# bag 139.000$            Agency priced 500# 50# bag 139.00$         Agency priced
4 Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag 304.94$              50# 25# bag 268.97$         

OTHER
1 K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. 15.08$                10 ton 50lb. no bid
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. $45.90/2.5gal SUB/GENERIC 165 gal. 55 gal. 1,205.00$      SUB/GENERIC
3 Harrells Max Iron MNMG 500 gal. 30 gals  $         610.8200 SUB/GENERIC 500 gal. 30 gal 410.00$          spec 
4 Harrells Max 4-0-8 50 gal 2.5 gal  no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal 45.00$            spec 

5 Harrells Max 4-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal  no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal 130.00$         spec
6 Harrells Max 18-3-6 50 gal 2.5 gal 35.23$                SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal 60.00$           spec
7 Harrells Max 12-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal 19.83$                SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal 45.00$           spec
8 Harrells Max 6-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal  8.26/x20#3 SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal 75.00$            spec 
9 Harrells Max 0-0-25 50 gal 2.5 gal 90.00$                SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal 70.00$           spec
10 Harrels EarthMax 50 gal 2.5 gal  $           50.0000 SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal 95.00$            spec 
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2/21/2019

Award to

Packaging Packaging
FUNGICIDES

1 Headway 10 gal. 1 gal. 417.00$              Agency priced 10 gal. 1 gal. 417.00$         Agency priced
2 Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 200.00$              Agency priced 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 200.00$         Agency priced
3 Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. 434.00$              SUB/GENERIC 6 gal. 1 gal. 509.00$         Agency priced

HERBICIDES
1 Prosedge or equivalent 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 47.50$                30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 47.29$           
2 Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal drum 345.00$              SUB/GENERIC 90 gal. 30 gal drum 570.33$         
3 Primo Link Pack 20 gal 10 gal 2,740.00$           Agency priced 20 gal 10 gal 2,740.00$      Agency priced
4 Revolver 30 qts 1 qt 235.00$               SUB/GENERIC 30 qts 1 qt 225.54$         
5 Barricade 4l 50 gal. 1 gal. 69.96$                 SUB/GENERIC 50 gal. 1 gal. 137.00$         Agency priced
6 Monument 1500 grams 25 gram box 220.00$              Agency priced 1500 grams 25 gram box 220.00$         Agency priced

7 Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 527.50$              50 gal. 2.5 gal. 525.50$         

8 Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 47.67$                this price for 1gal 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 116.67$         
9 Pendimethalin (Liquid) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. 65.00$                100 gal. 2.5 gal. 65.22$           
10 Specticle Flo 15 gal. 1 gal. 1,528.00$           Ageny priced 15 gal. 1 gal. 1,528.00$      Agency priced

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 12oz. Btls 12 oz. bottle 96.00$                   20 12oz. Btls 12 oz bottle 88.90$              
2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. 148.30$                 8 quarts Qt. 139.20$            
3 TopChoice 500# 50# bag 139.00$                 Agency priced 500# 50# bag 139.00$            Agency priced
4 Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag 268.75$                 50# 25# bag 179.38$            SUB/GENERIC

OTHER
1 K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. 12.29$                   10 ton 50lb. 9.21$                
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 30 gal. 1,050.00$              SUB/GENERIC 165 gal. 55 gal. no bid
3 Harrells Max Iron MNMG 500 gal. 30 gal. 330.00$                  SUB/GENERIC 500 gal. 50 gal no bid
4 Harrells Max 4-0-8 50 gal 2.5 gal 55.00/5ib SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
5 Harrells Max4-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal 30.00$                   SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
6 Harrells Max 18-3-6 50 gal 2.5 gal 37.50$                   SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
7 Harrells Max 12-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal 37.50$                    SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
8 Harrells Max 6-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal 30.00$                   SUB/GENERIC 50 gal 2.5 gal no bid
9 Harrels Max 0-0-25 50 gal 2.5 gal 30.00$                   SUB/GENERIC no bid

10 Harrels EarthMax 50 gal 2.5 gal 45.00$                   SUB/GENERIC no bid
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BWI Companies, IncHelena Agri Enterprises LLC
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2/21/2019

Award to

Packaging Packaging
FUNGICIDES

1 Headway 10 gal. 1 gal. no bid 10 gal. 1 gal. 438.00$         Agency priced
2 Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 202.50$         Agecy priced
3 Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. no bid 6 gal. 1 gal. 530.00$         Agecy priced

HERBICIDES
1 Prosedge or equivalent 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 56.00$                30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 56.00$           
2 Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal drum 450.00$              SUB/GENERIC 90 gal. 30 gal drum 586.80$         
3 Primo Link Pak 20 gal 10 gal no bid 20 gals 10 gal 2,740.00$      Agency priced
4 Revolver 30 qts 1 qt no bid 30 qts 1 qt 239.95$         
5 Barricade 4l 50 gal. 1 gal. 200.70$              SUB/GENERIC 50 gal. 1 gal. 143.00$         Agency priced
6 Monument 1500 grams 25 gram box no bid 1500 grams 25 gram box 245.00$         Agency priced
7 Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 578.75$         
8 Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 129.90$         
9 Pendimethalin (Liquid) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. 155.00$              100 gal. 2.5 gal. 102.90$         
10 Specticle Flo 15 gal. 1 gal. no bid 15 gal. 1 gal. 1,671.25$      Agency priced

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 12oz. Btls 12 oz. bottle no bid 20 12oz. Btls 12 oz. bottle 120.00$         
2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. no bid 8 quarts Qt. 172.50$         
3 TopChoice 500# 50# bag no bid 500# 50# bag 139.00$         Agency priced
4 Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag no bid 50# 25# bag 317.34$         

OTHER
1 K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. no bid 10 ton 50lb. 15.91$           
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. no bid 165 gal. 55 gal. 4,253.70$      
3 Harrells Max Iron MNMG 500 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid 500 gal. 2.5 gal. no bid
4 Harrells Max 4-0-8 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid
5 Harrells Max 4-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid
6 Harrells Max 18-3-6 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid
7 Harrells Max 12-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid
8 Harrells Max 6-0-0 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid
9 Harrells Max 0-0-25 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid

10 Harrels EarthMax 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid 50 gal 2.5 gal. no bid

Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product 

Winfield United

Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product 

Pennington Seed Inc

BID NUMBER:  005-19
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