
CITY OF EULESS
BID 013-19

ITEM Description:

Category 1

Clamps (SMITH BLAIR and ROMAC ONLY) Unit Cost
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

1 2" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 2.35" - 2.63" 28.23$                5 30.83$                   5

2 2" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 2.35" - 2.63" 45.63$                5 49.85$                   5

3 2" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 2.35" - 2.63" 47.38$                5 51.76$                   5

4 4" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 4.74" - 5.57" 51.42$                5 56.18$                   5

5 4" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 4.74" - 5.57" 68.83$                5 75.18$                   5

6 4" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 4.74" - 5.57" 80.24$                5 87.66$                   5

7 6" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 6.84" - 7.24" 43.65$                25 47.69$                   25

8 6" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.24" 61.06$                15 66.70$                   15

9 6" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.24" 77.05$                5 84.18$                   5

10 6" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 59.65$                25 65.16$                   25

11 6" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 77.05$                15 84.17$                   15

12 6" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 110.09$              5 120.27$                 5

13 6" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 6.56" - 6.96" 69.81$                15 76.27$                   15

14 6" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 6.84" - 7.24" 69.81$                15 76.27$                   15

15 6" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.24" 87.22$                15 95.28$                   15

16 6" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.24" 103.21$              5 112.75$                 5

17 6" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 89.50$                25 97.76$                   25

18 6" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 106.90$              15 116.77$                 15

19 6" x 15" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 119.30$              15 130.33$                 15

20 6" x 20" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 6.84" - 7.64" 159.07$              5 173.77$                 5

21 8" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 51.24$                25 55.98$                   25

22 8" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 68.65$                15 74.99$                   15

23 8" x 7 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 101.21$              10 110.57$                 10

24 8" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 8.99" - 9.79" 67.47$                25 73.70$                   25

25 8" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.79" 84.86$                15 92.71$                   15

26 8" x 7 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.79" 118.61$              10 129.58$                 10

27 8" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 82.07$                20 89.66$                   20

28 8" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 99.47$                15 108.67$                 15

29 8" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 115.47$              10 126.14$                 10

30 8" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range 8.99" - 9.79" 99.43$                20 108.61$                 20

31 8" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 1" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.79" 116.82$              15 127.62$                 15

32 8" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp with 2" CC Tap - OD Range 8.99" - 9.79" 132.82$              10 145.10$                 10

33 8" x 15" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 99.59$                15 108.80$                 15

34 8" x 25" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 8.99" - 9.39" 161.99$              5 176.96$                 5

35 10" x 12 1/2" Single Band Clamp - OD Range 9.65" - 10.05" 104.64$              5 114.32$                 5

36 10" x 12 1/2" Double Band Clamp - OD Range (oversized AC) 139.92$              10 171.74$                 10

37 12" x 15" Single Band Clamp - OD 13.10" - 13.50" 151.95$              5 166.00$                 5

38 12" x 15" Single Band Clamp - OD 14.10" - 14.50" 151.95$              10 166.00$                 10

39 12" x 18" Double Band Clamp - OD 13.65" - 14.65" 250.68$              10 273.85$                 10

Category 1 Total 3,753.94$           4,119.83$          

Ferguson Atlas Utility Supply Company

 

Third

Primary

Secondary



Category 2

Couplings (Romac (macro 2 bolt), Hymax, Smith-Blair(421)- ONLY) Unit Cost Quantity Unit Cost Quantity

40 2" 2-Bolt Coupling 103.93$              25 87.48$                   25

41 4" 2-Bolt Coupling 151.50$              20 144.81$                 20

42 6" 2-Bolt Coupling 219.92$              40 191.19$                 40

43 8" 2-Bolt Coupling 226.40$              40 216.52$                 40

44 10" 2-Bolt Coupling (oversize) 313.12$              10 299.81$                 10

45 12" 2-Bolt Coupling (oversize) 412.25$              10 400.66$                 10

Category 2 Total 1,427.12$           1,340.47$              

Category 3
Ductile Iron Resilient Seat Gate Valves (Mueler, M&H - ONLY)  Must 
Include Accessories, Bolts, Gland Packs, Mega Lugs, Flg Kits, ETC

Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

46 2" MJ X MJ 278.00$              5 272.66$                 5

47 2" MJ X Flange 278.00$              5 301.24$                 5

48 2" Flange X Flange 250.00$              5 224.69$                 5

49 4" MJ X MJ 375.90$              5 403.12$                 5

50 4" MJ X Flange 356.89$              5 363.86$                 5

51 4" Flange X Flange 367.03$              5 352.22$                 5

52 6" MJ X MJ 485.60$              30 513.31$                 30

53 6" MJ X Flange 479.64$              15 487.22$                 15

54 6" Flange x Flange 490.99$              15 477.72$                 15

55 8" MJ X MJ 757.91$              30 799.73$                 30

56 8" MJ X Flange 736.61$              15 753.40$                 15

57 8" Flange x Flange 756.32$              15 746.54$                 15

58 10" MJ X MJ 1,177.66$           10 1,264.06$              10

59 10" MJ X Flange 1,168.98$           5 1,196.40$              5

60 10" Flange x Flange 1,203.44$           5 1,170.97$              5

61 12" MJ X MJ 1,468.94$           10 1,563.61$              10

62 12" MJ X Flange 1,415.00$           5 1,430.17$              5

63 12" Flange x Flange 1,480.00$           5 1,410.80$              5

Category 3 Total 13,526.91$         13,731.70$            

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Ferguson 

Ferguson 



Category 4

Retainer Glands (Sigma, Ebba, Romac - ONLY)
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

64 2" Mega Lugs, (Cast Iron) w/Accessories 34.25$                10 27.66$                   10

65 2" Mega Lugs, (PVC) w/Accessories 34.25$                10 27.66$                   10

66 4" Mega Lugs, (Cast Iron) w/Accessories 29.50$                10 25.40$                   10

67 4" Mega Lugs, (PVC) w/Accessories 34.00$                10 29.20$                   10

68 6" Mega Lugs, (Cast Iron) w/Accessories 36.00$                10 31.38$                   10

69 6" Mega Lugs, (PVC) w/Accessories 42.00$                50 36.55$                   50

70 8" Mega Lugs, (PVC) w/Accessories 56.00$                50 49.32$                   50

71 8" Mega Lugs, (Cast Iron) w/Accessories 48.00$                10 42.76$                   10

72 10" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ Accessories 92.50$                20 85.86$                   20

73 10" Mega Lugs (Cast Iron) w/ Accessories 68.00$                10 60.80$                   10

74 12" Mega Lugs, (PVC) w/Accessories 99.00$                20 90.11$                   20

75 12" Mega Lugs, (Cast Iron) w/Accessories 90.00$                10 81.73$                   10

Category 4 Total 663.50$                   588.43$                 

No Bid #64 Complete

Category 5
Meter Boxes (DFW Plastics C-series only)  Lids must be recessed with 
AMR knock out

Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

76 36C Meter Box Lid Only 23.00$                200 23.09$                   200

77 37C Meter Box with Lid 78.65$                300 79.03$                   300

78 37C Meter Box Lid Only 31.75$                150 31.79$                   150

79 65C Meter Box with Lid 152.50$              200 155.98$                 200

80 65C Meter Box Lid Only 59.50$                100 59.77$                   100

Category 5 Total 345.40$              349.66$                 

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Ferguson 

Ferguson 



Category 6

Brass Fittings (NO LEAD) (FORD, Mueller, McDonald- Only)
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

3/4" Brass

81 1" long meter spud 7.53$                  100 -$                       100

82 1 1/2" long meter spud 8.55$                  150 15.66$                   150

83 2" long meter spud 7.53$                  200 9.76$                     200

84 2 1/2" long meter spud 7.53$                  250 7.29$                     250

85 3" long meter spud 9.13$                  250 18.51$                   250

86 90 Degree meter spud 11.06$                100 11.20$                   100

87 mip x compression 11.58$                250 12.01$                   250

88 fip x compression 12.18$                250 12.86$                   250

89 flare x mip 10.31$                100 10.66$                   100

90 fip x fip union 9.39$                  100 7.34$                     100

91 compression x compression coupling 14.11$                250 14.65$                   250

92 90 Degree fip x fip 3.75$                  100 2.82$                     100

93 90 Degree mip x compression 12.69$                150 12.48$                   150

94 90 Degree compression x compression coupling 18.24$                150 18.00$                   150

95 flare (w/ compression option) angle stop w/ locking ears 28.85$                300 29.23$                   300

96 fip angle stop with locking ears 24.05$                100 23.23$                   100

97 compression angle stop with locking ears 30.75$                300 31.17$                   300

98 fip x fip curb stop with locking ears 26.07$                200 43.44$                   200

99
compression x fip curb stop with locking ears - must be same length as 
Ford part#  bl41-233w-g-nl 32.40$                300 39.17$                   300

100
flair x fip curb stop with locking ears- must be same length as
Ford part# bl41-233w-g-nl 33.68$                300 40.75$                   300

101 3/4" to 1"  meter adapter 19.21$                200 7.88$                     200

102 3/4" to 1" compression x compression coupler 16.39$                100 16.16$                   100

103 fip x fip x fip tee 4.45$                  50 3.46$                     50

104 compression x compression x compression Tee 34.14$                50 33.67$                   50

105 cc thread corporation stop 25.28$                200 26.21$                   200

106 1" long IP nipple 1.70$                  50 1.21$                     50

107 3" long  IP nipple 2.85$                  50 2.05$                     50

108 6"  long IP nipple 5.40$                  50 3.91$                     50

109 9" long IP nipple 7.90$                  50 5.72$                     50

110 12" long IP nipple 10.35$                50 7.50$                     50

111 FIP x 1 1/2" MIP hex bushing 8.15$                  50 6.05$                     50

112 FIP x 2" MIP hex bushing 11.85$                50 8.84$                     50

1" Brass Unit Cost
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

113 1 1/2" long meter spud 11.26$                100 15.30$                   100

114 2 1/2" long meter spud 11.58$                100 24.66$                   100

115 mip x compression 13.72$                100 14.18$                   100

116 fip x compression 16.54$                100 18.39$                   100

117 flare x mip 14.72$                25 15.23$                   25

118 fip x fip union 13.00$                25 9.72$                     25

119 compression x compression coupling 16.23$                100 15.98$                   100

120 90 Degree fip x fip 5.55$                  50 4.34$                     50

121 90 Degree mip x compression 21.11$                50 21.57$                   50

122 90 Degree compression x compression coupling 23.42$                50 23.12$                   50

123 flare angle stop w/ locking ears 39.32$                100 39.81$                   100

124 compression angle stop with locking ears 42.10$                100 42.69$                   100

125 fip x fip curb stop with locking ears 63.45$                50 66.52$                   50

126 compression x fip curb stop with locking ears 70.63$                100 74.09$                   100

127 flair x fip curb stop with locking ears 68.02$                100 71.32$                   100

128 fip x fip x fip tee 8.25$                  25 6.14$                     25

129 compression x compression x compression Tee 36.54$                25 46.69$                   25

130 cc thread corporation stop 38.22$                50 39.70$                   50

131 1" long IP nipple 2.50$                  50 1.80$                     50

132 3" long  IP nipple 4.15$                  50 2.98$                     50

133 6"  long IP nipple 7.90$                  50 5.71$                     50

134 9" long IP nipple 11.75$                50 8.50$                     50

135 12" long IP nipple 15.55$                50 11.24$                   50

136 FIP x 1 1/2" MIP hex bushing 6.65$                  50 4.96$                     50

Atlas Utility Supply Company Ferguson 



137 FIP x 2" MIP hex bushing 11.85$                50 8.84$                     50

138 compression x 2 - 3/4" MIP u branch -  7 1/2" inch spread 37.30$                50 34.70$                   50

1 1/2" Brass Unit Cost
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

139 Meter Flange (fits 1 1/2" and 2" meters) 35.00$                100 46.93$                   100

140 mip x compression 37.59$                50 39.22$                   50

141 fip x compression 48.08$                50 50.15$                   50

142 cc thread corporation stop 110.20$              25 112.54$                 25

143 fip x fip union 22.50$                50 16.80$                   50

144 compression x compression coupling 54.01$                50 56.34$                   50

145 90 degree fip x fip 11.50$                50 11.98$                   50

146 90 degree mip x compression 61.32$                25 63.99$                   25

147 90 degree compression x compression 75.20$                50 78.50$                   50

148 compression angle stop with locking ears 142.52$              50 192.52$                 50

149 fip x flange angle stop with locking ears 115.00$              50 184.26$                 50

150 flare x flange angle stop with locking ears 140.00$              50 231.64$                 50

151 fip x fip curb stop with locking ears 126.50$              25 135.59$                 25

152 compression x fip curb stop with locking ears 148.53$              25 160.65$                 25

153 flare x fip curb stop with locking ears 150.00$              25 158.67$                 25

154 compression x compression coupling 54.01$                50 56.34$                   50

155 fip x fip x fip Tee 15.20$                25 11.85$                   25

156 compression x compression x compression Tee 81.50$                25 87.57$                   25

157 1" long IP nipple 4.87$                  25 3.53$                     25

158 3" long  IP nipple 7.25$                  25 5.22$                     25

159 6"  long IP nipple 13.89$                25 10.04$                   25

160 9" long IP nipple 20.65$                25 14.94$                   25

161 12" long IP nipple 27.25$                25 19.72$                   25

2" Brass Unit Cost
Estimated
Quantity unit cost

Estimated
Quantity

162 mip x compression 54.78$                50 57.15$                   50

163 fip x compression coupling 57.26$                50 59.77$                   50

164 fip x fip union 33.25$                50 25.86$                   50

165 compression x compression coupling 72.91$                50 76.09$                   50

166 90 degree fip x fip 35.25$                25 14.02$                   25

167 90 degree mip x compression 87.87$                25 91.68$                   25

168 90 degree compression x compression 152.18$              25 158.82$                 25

169 compression x flange angle stop with locking ears 187.00$              25 245.39$                 25

170 fip x flange angle stop  with locking ears 162.82$              25 252.03$                 25

171 flare x flange angle stop  with locking ears 187.00$              25 304.31$                 25

172 compression x Flange curb stop with locking ears 238.50$              25 222.60$                 25

173 fip x fip curb stop with locking ears 186.75$              25 197.40$                 25

174 compression x fip curb stop with locking ears 205.00$              25 222.60$                 25

175 flare x fip curb stop with locking ears 220.00$              25 232.98$                 25

176 compression x compression coupling 72.91$                50 76.09$                   50

177 fip x fip x fip Tee 24.85$                25 19.41$                   25

178 compression x compression x compression Tee 195.00$              25 213.79$                 25

179 cc thread corporation stop 182.27$              25 186.12$                 25

180 1" long IP nipple 7.15$                  25 5.37$                     25

181 3" long  IP nipple 8.85$                  25 6.68$                     25

182 6"  long IP nipple 17.10$                25 12.92$                   25

183 9" long IP nipple 25.40$                25 19.21$                   25

184 12" long IP nipple 33.65$                25 25.45$                   25

Double Strap Brass Tapping Saddles Unit Cost
Estimated
Quantity unit cost

Estimated
Quantity

185 6" x 1" CC 82.87$                25 86.62$                   25

186 6" X 1" IP 82.87$                15 86.62$                   15

187 6" x 2" CC 104.00$              25 107.74$                 25

188 6" X 2" IP 104.00$              15 107.74$                 15

189 8" x 1" CC 102.50$              25 107.25$                 25

190 8" X 1" IP 102.50$              15 107.25$                 15

191 8" x 2" CC 117.55$              25 121.75$                 25

192 8" X 2" IP 117.55$              15 121.75$                 15

193 10" x 1" CC 127.00$              10 132.86$                 10



194 10" X 1" IP 127.00$              5 132.86$                 5

195 10" x 2" CC 150.00$              10 155.10$                 10

196 10" X 2" IP 150.00$              5 155.09$                 5

197 12" x 1" CC 148.75$              10 155.52$                 10

198 12" X 1" IP 148.75$              5 155.52$                 5

199 12" x 2" CC 170.75$              10 176.74$                 10

200 12" X 2" IP 170.75$              5 176.74$                 5

Category 6 Total 7,035.52$    7,672.85$      

Complete Bid No Bid items 81,99, 100

Category 7

Gaskets
Estimated
Quantity

Estimated
Quantity

201 3/4" x 1/8" Rubber Meter Gaskets 0.10$                  2000 0.06$                     2000

202 3/4" Thin Fiber Meter Gaskets 0.08$                  1000 0.07$                     1000

203 1" x 1/8" Rubber Meter Gaskets 0.13$                  1000 0.09$                     1000

204 1" Thin Fiber Meter Gaskets 0.17$                  500 0.09$                     500

205 1 1/2" Rubber drop in gaskets 1.00$                  1000 0.60$                     1000

206 2" Rubber drop in gaskets 1.20$                  1000 0.70$                     1000

Category 7 Total 2.68$                  1.61$                     

Atlas Utility Supply Company Ferguson 



Category 8

PVC Pipe Feet Unit Cost Feet

207 2" PVC Water Pipe 100 0.54$                     100

208 4" PVC Water Pipe C-900 100 2.08$                     100

209 6" PVC Water Pipe, C-900 500 4.12$                     500

210 8" PVC Water Pipe, C-900 500 7.15$                     500

211 10" PVC Water Pipe, C-900 100 10.73$                   100

212 12" PVC Water Pipe, C-900 100 15.15$                   100

213 6" Ductile Iron Pipe 100 5.91$                     100

214 8" Ductile Iron Pipe 100 21.21$                   100

215 10" Ductile Iron Pipe 100 27.29$                   100

216 12" Ductile Iron Pipe 100 53.15$                   100

217 4" SDR 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 100 0.86$                     100

218 6" SDR 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 500 1.86$                     500

219 8" SDR 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 500 3.33$                     500

220 10" SDR 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 100 5.22$                     100

221 12" SDR 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 300 7.50$                     300

Category 8 Total 166.10$                 

Category 9

Poly Pipe Feet Unit Cost Feet

222 3/4" Poly Pipe 0.21$                  1000 0.25$                     1000

223 1" Poly Pipe 0.35$                  500 0.41$                     500

224 1 1/2" Poly Pipe 0.70$                  500 0.81$                     500

225 2" Poly Pipe 1.25$                  800 1.32$                     800

226 Inserts Quantity Quantity

227 ¾” INSERT                                                                                                1.21$                  500 1.11$                     500

228 1” INSERT                                                                                                1.30$                  300 1.34$                     300

229 1 ½” INSERT                                                                             1.77$                  300 1.67$                     300

230 2” INSERT                                                                                                1.77$                  400 2.23$                     400

Category 9 Total 8.56$                  9.14$                     

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         (No Bid for 
Catergory 08)

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Ferguson 

Ferguson 



Category 10

Sewer Fittings
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

231 3/4" I.P x Slip coupling 0.50$                      10 0.25$                     10

232 2" Female Adapter 1.25$                      2 1.01$                     2

233 3" PVC x PVC Boot Adapter 3.05$                      25 2.92$                     25

234 4" PVC x PVC Boot Adapter 3.95$                      25 3.66$                     25

235 4" Concrete x PVC Boot Adapter 4.26$                      25 3.94$                     25

236 4" Clay x PVC Boot Adapter 3.95$                      25 3.66$                     25

237 6" PVC x PVC Boot Adapter 8.50$                      25 7.81$                     25

238 6" Concrete x PVC Boot Adapter 9.35$                      25 8.64$                     25

239 6" Clay x PVC Boot Adapter 8.50$                      25 7.81$                     25

240 8" PVC x PVC Boot Adapter 13.00$                    25 12.02$                   25

241 8" Concrete x PVC Boot Adapter 14.00$                    25 12.98$                   25

242 8" Clay x PVC Boot Adapter 13.00$                    25 12.02$                   25

243 10" PVC x PVC Boot Adapter 19.50$                    25 18.04$                   25

244 10" Concrete x PVC Boot Adapter 19.50$                    25 18.04$                   25

245 10" Clay x PVC Boot Adapter 19.50$                    25 18.04$                   25

246 12" PVC x PVC Boot Adapter 23.00$                    25 21.06$                   25

247 12" Concrete x PVC Boot Adapter 23.00$                    25 21.06$                   25

248 12" Clay x PVC Boot Adapter 23.00$                    25 21.06$                   25

249 4" DWV 45 degree Bend (SCH 40) 8.00$                      25 5.06$                     25

250 4" DWV 22-1/2 degree Bend (SCH 40) 10.00$                    25 7.91$                     25

251 4" DWV Coupling (SCH 40) SWeld X SWeld 3.00$                      25 3.41$                     25

252 4" DWV  PVC Long Sweep T-Wye for C.O. (SCH 40) 30.00$                    25 17.90$                   25

253 4" SCH 40 to SDR 35 Spigot Sweld 7.95$                      25 7.59$                     25

254 4" Bell and Spigot 45 degree bend (Schedule 35) 3.50$                      25 3.21$                     25

255 4" Bell and Spigot 22-1/2 degree bend (Schedule 35) 3.50$                      25 3.21$                     25

256 6" PVC SDR 35 Push Plug 4.80$                      25 4.84$                     25

257 8" PVC SDR 35 Push Plug 17.00$                    25 17.17$                   25

258 4" DWV Threaded Plug 3.00$                      25 2.08$                     25

259 4" Brass Plug (countersunk) 75.00$                    25 7.68$                     25

260 4" Combo Cleanout (SCH 40) 32.00$                    25 13.38$                   25

261 4" Backflow Preventer (SCH 40) 45.00$                    25 26.41$                   25

262 4" Collars w/Screw Cap 10.00$                    25 6.10$                     25

263 6" X 4" SDR 35 T-Wye B X B X B 26.00$                    25 25.94$                   25

264 8" X 4" SDR 35 T-Wye B X B X B 35.00$                    25 37.79$                   25

265 8" X 4" Sewer Saddle Tee, Gasketed SDR 35 24.00$                    25 21.95$                   25

266 10" X 4" Sewer Saddle Tee, Gasketed SDR 35 42.00$                    25 38.79$                   25

267 12" X 4" Sewer Saddle Tee, Gasketed SDR 35 49.00$                    25 48.13$                   25

268 15" X 4" Sewer Saddle Tee, Gasketed SDR 35 305.00$                  25 59.35$                   25

Category 10 Total 944.56$       551.92$         

No Bid Item #262

Ferguson Atlas Utility Supply Company



Category 11

Valve Boxes  (Sigma)
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

269 1" Valve Box Extension 10.00$                30 5.98$                     30

270 2" Valve Box Extension 14.00$                20 8.70$                     20

271 3" Valve Box Extension 16.00$                20 9.78$                     20

272 4" Valve Box Extension 18.00$                15 11.96$                   15

273 6" Valve Box Extension 24.02$                10 15.22$                   10

274 18" to 24" w/Lids 32.00$                40 30.44$                   40

275 24" to 36" w/Lids 44.00$                40 44.30$                   40

276 18" to 24" Top Only 16.00$                15 13.04$                   15

277 24" to 36" Top Only 20.00$                15 16.31$                   15

Category 11 Total 194.02$              155.72$                 

Category 12

Mueller Fire Hydrant Parts
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

278 Safety Stem Coupling (BEFORE 1972)  [IMPROVRD OLD STYLE] 5 97.56$                       5

279 Safety Sleeve w/Set Screws (BEFORE 1972)   NOT NECESSARY WITH 5 -$                           5

280 Safety Set Screws (BEFORE 1972) 5 -$                           5

281 Oil Filler Plug 5 3.58$                         5

282 Extension Kit (1972 - Present) 5 261.11$                     5

283 Safety Flange Kit (1972 - Present) 5 133.33$                     5

284 Improved Upper Stem 5 161.90$                     5

285 Improved Lower Stem 5 143.11$                     5

286 Centurion Lower Stem 5 136.86$                     5

287 Centurion Lower Stem 5 136.86$                     5

288 Solid Thimble (Brass) 5 -$                           5

289 Bonnet Kit - IMPROVED 5 60.09$                       5

290 6” Extension kits - CENTURION 5 261.11$                     5

291 12” Extension kits - 5 1/4 CENTURION                                                            5 300.00$                     5

292 Traffic repair kits                                                                                   5 133.33$                     5

293 Bonnet repair kits                                                                                   5 63.46$                       5

294 Main seat repair kits - PRIOR TO 1997 ONLY                                            5 415.27$                     5

295 Upper stems - #11                                                           5 154.81$                     5

296 Drain Facing Screws 5 1.50$                         5

297 Anti-friction Washers 5 2.04$                         5

298 Drain Facings 5 3.46$                         5

299 Safety Stem Coupling  5 66.30$                       5

300 Lower Valve Plate 5 66.30$                       5

301 Operating Nut 5 174.78$                     5

302 Upper Valve Plate 5 167.73$                     5

303 Hold Down Nut 5 6.88$                         5

304 Main seat valve 5 ¼” 97 & later                                                            5 136.86$                     5

305 Main seat valve 5 ¼” 97 & prior - #45                                             5 136.86$                     5

Category 12 Total 3,225.07$              

No Bids # 279, 280,288

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                      

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         (No Bid for 
Catergory 12)

Ferguson 

Ferguson 



Category 13

M&H Fire Hydrant Parts
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

306 6" F. H. Riser New Style 129 w/Access. 190.00$              5 419.73$                 5

307 12" F. H. Riser New Style 129 w/ Access. 230.00$              5 490.13$                 5

308 18" F. H. Riser New Style 129 w/Access. 265.00$              5 556.27$                 5

309 Traffic Repair kit New Style 105.00$              5 189.87$                 5

310 Traffic Repair kit Old Style 129 105.00$              5 189.87$                 5

311 Safety Stem  Couplings 71.25$                5 55.00$                   5

312 5/8" X 3-3/4" Break-a-way Bolts (5/8" Nut) 23.00$                5 16.87$                   5

313 Old 129Flat Bonnet Gasket 20.00$                5 14.67$                   5

314 Drain Facing 13.00$                5 9.53$                     5

315 Drain Facing Rivets 3.00$                  5 2.20$                     5

316 Upper Valve Plate 275.00$              5 207.53$                 5

317 Lower Valve Plate 120.00$              5 89.47$                   5

318 Operating Nut -New Style 295.00$              5 120.27$                 5

319 Weather Shield 45.00$                5 35.20$                   5

320 Weather shield Bolt MH129 3.00$                  5 2.20$                     5

321 Seal Plate O-Ring 4" Valve 7.00$                  5 5.13$                     5

322 MHV2C1164 HD Nut Set Screw 5.00$                  5 2.20$                     5

323 MHV Bonnet 386.00$              5 283.07$                 5

324 Rod Bonnet O-Ring 8.00$                  5 5.87$                     5

325 MHV Bonnet O-Ring 8.00$                  5 3.66$                     5

326 MHV210222 #7 Thrust Washer 5.00$                  5 11.00$                   5

327 Hold Down Nut 119.00$              5 87.27$                   5

328 Upper Stem Assembly 203.00$              5 148.87$                 5

Category 13 Total 2,504.25$               2,945.86$                  

No Bids #321, 323 No Bids #321, 323

Category 14 Ferguson           (No Bid for Catergory 14)

Clow Hydrant Parts
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

329 6" Extension Kits 5 5

330 12" Extension Kits 5 5

331 Traffic Repair Kits 5 5

332 Main Seat Repair Kits 5 5

333 Upper Stems - #7 5 5

334 Main Seat Valve - #21 5 5

335 Safety Stem Coupling 5 5

336 Upper Valve Plate Bronze 5 5

337 Seat Ring 5 5

338 Drain Valve Facing Pins 5 5

339 Drain Facing 5 5

340 Operating Nut 5 5

341 Thrust Nut 5 5

Category 14 Total

Category 15

American Darling Hydrant Parts
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

342 6" Extension Kit 5 158.12$                 5

343 12" Extension Kit 5 184.62$                 5

344 Traffic Repair Kit 5 100.21$                 5

345 Main Seat Repair Kit 5 143.56$                 5

346 Upper Stem 5 195.07$                 5

347 Main Valve                       5 101.33$                 5

Category 15 Total 882.91$                 

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         (No Bid for 
Catergory 14)

Atlas Utility Supply Company

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         (No Bid for 
Catergory 14)

Ferguson 

Ferguson 



Category 16
Fire Hydrants (M&H style 129, America Darling B-84-B, Mueller Centurion- 
MODELS ONLY)

Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

348 3 1/2'  Bury Fire Hydrant w/ Gland Pack 1,580.00$           10 1,661.34$              10

349 4 1/2' Bury Fire Hydrant w/ Gland Pack 1,650.00$           15 1,736.54$              15

350 5 1/2' Bury Fire Hydrant w/ Gland Pack 1,725.00$           10 1,815.95$              10

Category 16 Total 4,955.00$           5,213.82$              

Category 17

5" HYDRA-STORZ CONNECTER AND CAPS
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

351 STORZ Connecter 159.50$              40 153.32$                 40

352 Storz Cap 62.00$                40 58.82$                   40

Category 17 Total 221.50$              212.14$                 

Category 18

Ductile Iron Fittings  (Sigma, Tyler Only)
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

353 6" MJ x Flange Sleeve 48.00                  5 45.22$                       5

354 6"  MJ x MJ x MJ Tee 86.00                  5 81.39$                       5

355 6"  MJ x MJ x Flange Tee 99.00                  5 93.57$                       5

356 6" MJ x MJ 22.5 Degree Bend 45.00                  5 41.74$                       5

357 6" MJ x Flange 22.5 Degree Bend 75.00                  5 70.26$                       5

358 6" MJ x MJ 45 Degree Bend 49.00                  5 45.91$                       5

359 6" MJ x Flange 45 Degree Bend 67.00                  5 62.67$                       5

360 6" MJ x MJ 90 Degree Bend 60.00                  5 56.35$                       5

361 6" MJ x Flange 90 Degree Bend 74.00                  5 69.57$                       5

362 6" MJ end of Pipe Cap 25.00                  5 22.96$                       5

363 6" MJ end of pipe Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 39.00                  5 36.87$                       5

364 6" MJ end of fitting Cap 32.00                  5 30.26$                       5

365 6" MJ end of fitting Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 46.00                  5 43.48$                       5

366 6" end of pipe Plug 35.00                  5 31.67$                       5

367 6" end of pipe Plug w/ 2" IP tap 50.00                  5 45.15$                       5

368 6" MJ x MJ Connector 55.00                  5 88.60$                       5

369 6" MJ x 6" MJ x 8" MJ reducing tee 170.00                5 159.65$                     5

370 6" MJ x 6" MJ x 8" Flange reducing tee 290.00                5 - 5

371 6" MJ to 8"MJ Reducer 51.00                  5 47.65$                       5

372 6" MJ to 8"Flange Reducer 275.00                5 147.07$                     5

373 6" MJ x 8" MJ Cross 130.00                5 122.78$                     5

374 8" MJ x Flange Sleeve 72.00                  5 68.17$                       5

375 8"  MJ x MJ x MJ Tee 130.00                5 121.74$                     5

376 8"  MJ x MJ x Flange Tee 153.00                5 144.35$                     5

377 8" MJ x MJ 22.5 Degree Bend 69.00                  5 65.04$                       5

378 8" MJ x Flange 22.5 Degree Bend 115.00                5 108.52$                     5

379 8" MJ x MJ 45 Degree Bend 71.00                  5 66.78$                       5

380 8" MJ x Flange 45 Degree Bend 128.00                5 120.35$                     5

381 8" MJ x MJ 90 Degree Bend 87.00                  5 81.74                 5

382 8" MJ x Flange 90 Degree Bend 128.00                5 120.70               5

383 8" MJ end of Pipe Cap 40.00                  5 37.57                 5

384 8" MJ end of pipe Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 55.00                  5 51.13                 5

385 8" MJ end of fitting Cap 48.00                  5 44.87                 5

386 8" MJ end of fitting Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 62.00                  5 58.43                 5

387 8" end of pipe Plug 48.00                  5 44.52                 5

388 8" end of pipe Plug w/ 2" IP tap 62.00                  5 57.74                 5

389 8" MJ x MJ Connector 90.00                  5 130.92               5

390 8" MJ x 8" MJ x 10" MJ reducing tee 365.00                5 5

391 8" MJ x 8" MJ x 10" Flange reducing tee 440.00                5 5

392 8" MJ to 10"MJ Reducer 72.00                  5 67.48                 5

393 8" MJ to 10"Flange Reducer 425.00                5 5

394 8" MJ x 10" MJ Cross 210.00                5 196.17               5

395 10" MJ x Flange Sleeve 125.00                2 118.26               2

396 10"  MJ x MJ x MJ Tee 184.00                2 173.92               2

397 10"  MJ x MJ x Flange Tee 280.00                2 264.35               2

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Ferguson 

Ferguson 

Ferguson 



398 10" MJ x MJ 22.5 Degree Bend 102.00                2 96.35                 2

399 10" MJ x Flange 22.5 Degree Bend 168.00                2 157.92               2

400 10" MJ x MJ 45 Degree Bend 103.00                2 96.70                 2

401 10" MJ x Flange 45 Degree Bend 187.00                2 176.35               2

402 10" MJ x MJ 90 Degree Bend 138.00                2 129.74               2

403 10" MJ x Flange 90 Degree Bend 210.00                2 197.22               2

404 10" MJ end of Pipe Cap 52.00                  2 46.96                 2

405 10" MJ end of pipe Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 65.00                  2 60.52                 2

406 10" MJ end of fitting Cap 83.00                  2 78.26                 2

407 10" MJ end of fitting Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 98.00                  2 91.83                 2

408 10" end of pipe Plug 74.00                  2 69.22                 2

409 10" end of pipe Plug w/ 2" IP tap 88.00                  2 82.79                 2

410 10" MJ x MJ Connector 105.00                2 194.42               2

411 10" MJ x 10" MJ x 12" MJ reducing tee 465.00                2 2

412 10" MJ x 10" MJ x 12" Flange reducing tee 575.00                2 2

413 10" MJ to 12"MJ Reducer 98.00                  2 91.83                 2

414 10" MJ to 12"Flange Reducer 645.00                2 636.58               2

415 10" MJ x 12" MJ Cross 385.00                2 362.79               2

416 12" MJ x Flange Sleeve 160.00                2 151.65               2

417 12"  MJ x MJ x MJ Tee 257.00                2 242.79               2

418 12"  MJ x MJ x Flange Tee 365.00                2 345.05               2

419 12" MJ x MJ 22.5 Degree Bend 134.00                2 126.26               2

420 12" MJ x Flange 22.5 Degree Bend 244.00                2 230.26               2

421 12" MJ x MJ 45 Degree Bend 153.00                2 144.35               2

422 12" MJ x Flange 45 Degree Bend 279.00                2 263.31               2

423 12" MJ x MJ 90 Degree Bend 185.00                2 174.61               2

424 12" MJ x Flange 90 Degree Bend 300.00                2 283.48               2

425 12" MJ end of Pipe Cap 75.00                  2 70.26                 2

426 12" MJ end of pipe Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 90.00                  2 84.18                 2

427 12" MJ end of fitting Cap 82.00                  2 77.22                 2

428 12" MJ end of fitting Cap w/ 2" IP Tap 96.00                  2 90.09                 2

429 12" end of pipe Plug 84.00                  2 78.96                 2

430 12" end of pipe Plug w/ 2" IP tap 98.00                  2 92.52                 2

431 12" MJ x MJ Connector 148.00                2 200.51               2

Category 18 Total 11,651.00           8,710.46$          

No Bid# 367,370,388,390,391,411, 412 No Bid 369,390,391,411, 412



Category 19
Manhole Rings & Lids, Extension Rings, Cleanouts (Pamrex ONLY) NO 
SUBSTITUTES

Estimated
Quantity

Estimated
Quantity

432 24" Ring and Cover 355.00 3 324.18$                 3

433 30" Ring and Cover 650.00 10 624.18$                 10

434 Sanitary Cleanout Boot Set 248.00 5 66.81$                   5

435 Sanitary Cleanout Boot Lid Only 30.00 10 15.00$                   10

Category 19 Total 1,283.00 1,030.17$              

Category 20

Manhole Rings & Lids Pamrex Only
Estimated
Quantity

Estimated
Quantity

436 24" Pamrex Ring and Cover 355.00 3 324.18$                 3

437 30" Pamrex Ring and Cover 650.00 10 624.18$                 10

Category 20 Total 1,005.00 948.35$                 

Category 21

Manhole Extension Rings (Bass & Hayes or Equal) DOMESTIC ONLY
Estimated
Quantity

Estimated
Quantity

438 2 5/8" Riser 155.00 150 14.57$                   150

439 3" Riser 320.00 150 315.22$                 150

440 4" Riser 205.00 150 179.35$                 150

441 6" Riser 298.00 150 269.57$                 150

Category 21 Total 978.00 778.70$                 

Category 22

Manhole Grade Rings (Plastic) Ladtech ONLY
Estimated
Quantity

Estimated
Quantity

442 24" Diameter  - 2" 5 26.90$                   5

443 24" Diameter  - 4" 5 46.20$                   5

444 24" Diameter  - Slope 5 26.90$                   5

445 30" Diameter - 2 1/4" 5 37.42$                   5

446 30" Diameter - 4" 5 46.20$                   5

447 30" Diameter - Slope 5 37.42$                   5

Category 22 Total 221.04$                 

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         

Ferguson 

Ferguson 

Ferguson ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                        

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         (No Bid for 
Catergory 22)

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY                         

Ferguson 



Category 23

Miscellaneous
Estimated
Quantity Unit Cost

Estimated
Quantity

448 Vita-D-Chlor (Dechlorination tablets - 140 count) 725.00$              10 661.77$                 10

449 Fire Hydrant Meter 775.00$              10 896.44$                     10

450 Eclipse#88-SS  Sample Station 895.00$              10 820.68$                     10

451 Eclipse #9400 Automatic Flush Station 3,295.00$           10 2,914.73$                  10

Category 23 Total 5,690.00$           5,293.61$              

Category 24

Reclaimed Water Distribution/ Maintenance
Estimated
Quantity

Estimated
Quantity

452 Purple Poly Wrap  Trumbull Item # 388-8815 300 ft.  14"-16" 1 1

453 DFW-1500.12.5 Box with Purple Lid AMR Knockout 50 50

454 Purple locator flags 1000 1000

455 Purple inverted locate paint 100 100

456 Mueller 4" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x M.J. 1 1

457 Mueller 4" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x FLG. 1 1

458 Mueller 6" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x M.J. 1 1

459 Mueller 6" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x FLG. 1 1

460 Mueller 8" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x M.J. 1 1

461 Mueller 8" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x FLG. 1 1

462 Mueller 10" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x M.J. 1 1

463 Mueller 10" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x FLG. 1 1

464 Mueller 12" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x M.J. 1 1

465 Mueller 12" A-2361 RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVES - M.J. x FLG. 1 1

466 Mueller 16" 2361 Series Resilient Wedge Gate Valve M.J.x M.J. 1 1

467 Mueller 16" 2361 Series Resilient Wedge Gate Valve M.J.x FLG. 1 1

468
4"  Star Grip PVC - Series 4000 for PVC and CI, w/acceriores
 and trans gasket 2 2

469
6"  Star Grip PVC - Series 4000 for PVC and CI, w/acceriores
 and trans gasket 2 2

470
8"  Star Grip PVC - Series 4000 for PVC and CI, w/acceriores
 and trans gasket 2 2

471
10"  Star Grip PVC - Series 4000 for PVC and CI, w/acceriores
 and trans gasket 2 2

472
12"  Star Grip PVC     Series 4000 for PVC and CI, w/acceriores
 and trans gasket 2 2

473
16"  Star Grip PVC     Series 4000 for PVC and CI, w/acceriores
 and trans gasket 2 2

474 4"  C900-DR18 PVC Purple 100 100

475 6"  C900-DR18 PVC Purple 100 100

476 8"  C900-DR18 PVC Purple 100 100

477 10"  C900-DR18 PVC Purple 100 100

478 12"  C900-DR18 PVC Purple 100 100

479 16"  C900-DR18 PVC Purple 100 100

480 2" DR11 200 PSI. Purple HDPE-IPS 100 100

481
2" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D. Range  2.35-2.63 HDPE Smith-Blair-ONLY 

4 4

482
3" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D. Range 3.46-3.70 HDPE 
Smith-Blair only 4 4

483
4" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D. Range 4.45-4.73 HDPE 
Smith-Blair only 4 4

484
6" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D.  Range 6.56-6.96 HDPE
Smith-Blair only 4 4

485
8" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D.Range 8.54-8.94 HDPE
Smith-Blair only 4 4

486
10" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D. Range 10.64-11.04 HDPE
Smith-Blair only 4 4

487
12" Single Band Repair Clamp O.D. Range 12.62-13.02 HDPE
Smith-Blair only 4 4

488 2" Angle Stop  IP Threads  x Meter Flange 6 6

489 2" Male IPxCompression IPS Size 2 2

490 2" Female IPxCompression IPS Size 2 2

491 2" CompressionxCompression IPS Size 2 2

492 2" Drop in Gaskets 100 100

493 2" Meter Bolts Kit 50 50

494 2" Valve Box Extension 2 2

495 4" Valve Box Extension 2 2

496 6" Valve Box Extension 2 2

497 18" to 24" w/ Deep Lids Reclaimed Water 2 2

498 24" to 36" w/ Deep Lids Reclaimed Water 2 2

499 18" to 24" Top Only 1 1

500 24" to 36" Top Only 1 1

501 Valve box Lids Reclaimed Water 25 25

Atlas Utility Supply Company

ATLAS UTILITY SUPPLY     (No Bid for Catergory 24)

Ferguson 

Ferguson    (No Bid for Catergory 24)



502 2” INSERT-SS- IPS                                                                                              200 200

503 2" IPS x FIP 2 2

504 2" IPS x MIP 2 2

505 2” flange x 2” PVC Comp                      2 2

506 2” flange x 2” IPS Comp                            2 2

507 2” IPS x 1 ½” IPS                                     2 2

508 2” MIPS x 2” FIP                                           2 2

Category 24 Total



TOTAL CATEGORY 1
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 1 3,753.94$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 1 4,119.83$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 2
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 2 1,427.12$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 2 1,340.47$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 3
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 3 13,526.91$         
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 3 13,731.70$       

TOTAL CATEGORY 4
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 4 663.50$              
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 4 588.43$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 5
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 5 345.40$              
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 5 349.66$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 6
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 6  7,035.52$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 6  7,672.85$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 7
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 7 2.68$                  
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 7 1.61$                

TOTAL CATEGORY 8
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 8 -$                    
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 8 166.10$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 9
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 9 8.56$                  
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 9 9.14$                

TOTAL CATEGORY 10
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 10 944.56$              
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 10 551.92$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 11
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 11 194.02$              
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 11 155.72$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 12
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 12 -$                    
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 12 3,225.07$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 13
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 13 2,504.25$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 13 2,945.86$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 14
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 14 -$                    
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 14 -$                  

TOTAL CATEGORY 15
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 15 -$                    
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 15 882.91$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 16
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 16 4,955.00$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 16 5,213.82$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 17
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 17 221.50$              
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 17 212.14$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 18
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 18 11,651.00$         
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 18 8,710.46$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 19
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 19 1,283.00$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 19 1,030.17$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 20
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 20 1,005.00$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 20 948.35$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 21
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 21 978.00$              
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 21 778.70$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 22
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 22 -$                    
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 22 221.04$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 23
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 23 5,690.00$           
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 23 5,293.61$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 24
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 24 -$                    
TOTAL 

CATEGORY 24 -$                  

TOTAL CATEGORY 1 3,753.94$           4,119.83$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 2 1,427.12$           1,340.47$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 3 13,526.91$         13,731.70$       

TOTAL CATEGORY 4 663.50$              588.43$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 5 345.40$              349.66$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 6 7,035.52$           7,672.85$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 7 2.68$                  1.61$                

TOTAL CATEGORY 8 -$                    166.10$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 9 8.56$                  9.14$                

TOTAL CATEGORY 10 944.56$              551.92$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 11 194.02$              155.72$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 12 -$                    3,225.07$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 13 2,504.25$           2,945.86$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 14 -$                    -$                  

TOTAL CATEGORY 15 -$                    882.91$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 16 4,955.00$           5,213.82$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 17 221.50$              212.14$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 18 11,651.00$         8,710.46$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 19 1,283.00$           1,030.17$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 20 1,005.00$           948.35$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 21 978.00$              778.70$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 22 -$                    221.04$            

TOTAL CATEGORY 23 5,690.00$           5,293.61$         

TOTAL CATEGORY 24 -$                    -

Blue Tertiary

Green Secondary

Atlas Utility Supply Company

Blue Tertiary

Green Secondary

Atlas Utility Supply Company Ferguson 

Ferguson 

 

Yellow Primary

Yellow Primary


