
REDI-MIX CONCRETE FOX RENTAL

Euless, Texas Grapevine, Texas

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PER YARD PRICE PER YARD

Ready Mix Concrete (3,000 psi)

1 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Pick Up $101.50 $190.61

2 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Delivered $110.50 $190.61

3 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Pick Up $131.00 $190.61

4 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Delivered $140.00 $190.61

5 YARD Qty less than 3 yrds, Pick Up $131.00 $190.61

Ready Mix Concrete (3,500 psi)

6 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Pick Up $104.00 $215.05

7 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Delivered $113.00 $215.05

8 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Pick Up $134.00 $215.05

9 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Delivered $143.00 $215.05

10 YARD Qty less than 3 yrds, Pick Up $134.00 $215.05

Ready Mix Concrete (4,000 psi)

11 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Pick Up $107.00 NO BID

12 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Delivered $116.00 NO BID

13 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Pick Up $137.00 NO BID

14 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Delivered $146.00 NO BID

15 YARD Qty less than 3 yrds, Pick Up $137.00 NO BID

Ready Mix Concrete (4,500 psi)

16 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Pick Up $110.00 NO BID

17 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Delivered $119.00 NO BID

18 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Pick Up $140.00 NO BID

19 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Delivered $149.00 NO BID

20 YARD Qty less than 3 yrds, Pick Up $140.00 NO BID

Ready Mix Concrete (5,000 psi)

21 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Pick Up $113.00 NO BID

22 YARD Qty greater than 6 yards, Delivered $122.00 NO BID

23 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Pick Up $143.00 NO BID

24 YARD Qty greater than 3 yards, Delivered $152.00 NO BID

25 YARD Qty less than 3 yrds, Pick Up $143.00 NO BID

Flowable Fill Concrete - Delivered  

26 YARD 08 Mix $98.50 NO BID

27 YARD 09 Mix No Bid NO BID

 Additional Price Per Cubic Yard

28 --

Fiber mesh 650 or “approved equivalent” 
macro-synthetic fiber reinforced concrete $6.00 NO BID

 Normal Delivery time to City of Euless

City of Euless Bid Tabulation

Bid No. 009-16


