Attachment A

Entity Participation

Unleaded Unleaded Unleaded No. 2 ULSD
Reguiar Mid-Grade Plus TxLED Red Dyed B10 B20
Entity Gasoline Gasoline Gasoline E-85 Diesel Diesel Biodiesel Biodiesel

Town of Addison - 80,000 20,000
City of Allen 180,000 85,000
City of Carrollton 264,353 102,640 3,350
City of Coppell 90.000 45,000
City of Denton 300,000 50,000 300,000 725,000
Denton County 202,000 162,000
City of Desoto 128,000 39,000
City of Duncanville 70,000 43,000
City of Euless 115,000 ' 30,000 15,000
City of Farmers Branch 116,800 59,800
Town of Flower Mound 125,000 28,000 64,000
City of Frisco 300,000 110,000
City of Garland 650,000 630,000 130,000
City of Grand Prairie 444 788 193,825 111,310
City of Grapevine 80,000 100,000 120,000
HEB ISD 42,700 126,800
City of Lancaster 126,000 57,750
City of Lewisville 227,290 84,298
City of Mesquite 4,000 438,536 167,602
Northwest 1SD 25,000 325,000
City of Plano 3,000 80,000
City of Richardson 239,296 200,253 37.265
City of The Calony 13,000 10,000

TOTALS: 3,733,227 518,536 0 176,000 2,883,968 364,660 15,000 807,265
Tarrant County 290,090 238,860

TOTALS: 4,023,317 518,536 0 176,000 3,122,828 364,660 15,000 307,265

| Grand Total Gallons: | 9,027,606 |
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SECTION ONE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

.Bid Award Recommendation

PRIMARY

Alternate “Secondary
. | Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum :
Douglass Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAGC Energy
Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, M! Dalias, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Plus / Plus / Plus f ‘ Plus'f Plus /
EST. . Minus Total Bid Minus | Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus {* ~ Total Bid Minus Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount . Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount
Reformulated Unleaded
“iRegular Gasoling, _

Transport Load (7,500 Even : Minus Plus Plus Plus
1 jgallons or more) 1,675,873 ¢ .00C0 0.00§ .0320. (53,631.14) .0087 14,580.97 § .0623 104,413.12 § .0029 4.860.32

Reformulated Unleaded

Regular Gasoling, Short _ _

Load {4,000 gallons to S Plus Minus Plus Plus Plus
2 17,499 gailons) 1,347,255 § .0800 80,835.30§ .0115 (15,493.43)f .0187 25,193.67 | .0808 108,858.20 § .0212 28.561.81

Reformulated Unleaded

Regular Gasaline, Tank :

Wagon Load (3,958 gallons Plus _ Plus Plus _ Plus _ Plus
3 jorless) 1,000,189 § .0800 80,015.12§ .1850 185,034.97% .0387 38,707.31.§ 1743 174,332.94 § .0875 87,516.54




BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

SECTION ONE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

Bid Award Recommendation

Alternate PRIMARY Secondary
Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum
Douglass Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX Milfard, PA Denton, TX Romulus, Mi Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Pius / Plus / Plus / Plus / Plus/
EST. Minus Totat Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus {  Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount
Reformulated Unleaded MidH
Grade Gasoline, Transport
Lead (7,500 gallons or Even Minus Plus Plus Plus
4 lmore) 80,000 .0000 0.00§ .0320 (2,560.00) .0087 696.00 § .0623 4,984.00 ¢ .005€ 448.00
Reformulated Unieaded Mid4
Grade Gasoling, Short Load
(4,000 galions to 7,499 Plus Minus Plus Plus Plus
5 {gallons) 438,536 £ .0800 26,312.16] .0115 (5,043.16)f .0187 8,200.62 § .0808 35,433.71 § .0329 14,427.83
Reformulated Unleaded Mid
Grade Gasoline, Tank
Wagon Load (3,999 gallons Plus Plus Plus Plus Plus
6 |orless) 1 .0800 0.08] .1850 0.19 | .0387 0.04 § 1743 0.17 § .0902 0.09




SECTION ONE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

Bid Award Recommendation

Alternate PRIMARY ‘Secondary
. " Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Qi RKA Petroleum
Douglass Distributing Solutions Company Corperation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, MI Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUBE - No
“Plus J Plus / - Plus / Plus f - _ Plus f _
EST. Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus- Total Bid
ITEM - DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. - Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount - - Diff. Amount
Reformulated Unleaded
Plus Gasoline, Transport : _
Load {7,500 gallons or Even Minus Plus Plus Minus
7 jmare) 1 :0000 0.00§ .0320 (0.03)f .0087 0.01 § .0623 0.06 § .0441 (0.04)
Reformulzated Unleaded
Plus Gasoline, Short Load
{4,000 gailons to 7,499 ~ Plus Minus _ Plus Plus Minus
8 igallons) 1 0600 0.06y 0715 (0.01); .0187 | 0.02 ; .0808 0.08 § .0258 (0.03)
Reformuiated Unleaded .
Plus Gascline, Tank Wagon| Plus Plus Plus Plus : Plus
9 iload (3,999 gallcns or less) 1 .0800 0.08] .2250 0.23¢ .0387 }. 0.04 § 1743 0.17 § .C408 0.04
E-85 Gasoling, Transport
Load {7,500 gallens or -Even Plus Plus Plus Plus
10 fmore) 50,000 .0000 0.00§ .0275 1,375.00¢ .0315 1,575.00 § .0701 3,605.00 § .0192 860.00




BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

SECTION ONE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL
Bid Award Recommendation

Alternate PRIMARY Secondary
Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum
Douglass Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, MI Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Plus / Plus / Plus / Plus / ' Plus /
EST. Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Totat Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount
E£-85 Gasoline, Short ]
Transport Load {4,000 Plus Plus Plus Plus Plus
11 lgallons to 7,499) 100,000 § .0800 6,000.00§ .0300 3,000.00f .0415 4,150.00 § .0313 9,130.00 § .0375 3,750.00
E-85 Fthano!, Tank Wagon Plus Plus Plus Plus Plus :
12 iLoad (3,998 gallons or less){ 28,000 .0800 2,080.00§ .3500 g,100.00f .0615 1,599.00 § .1743 4,531.80 § .1038 2,658.80
No. 2 ULSD TxLED Diesal, .
Transport Load (7,500 Even Plus Minus Plus Plus
13 |gallons or more) 1,016,300 § .0000 0.00f .006 6,007 80F .0037 (3,760.31)§ .0576 58,538.88 f .0088 9,959.74
Ne. 2 ULSD TxLED Diesel,
Short Transport Load :
(4,000 gallons to 7,468 Plus Plus Plus Plus Plus
14 igallons) 1,083,163 { .0600 §4,990.14§ .0125 13,539.61¢ .0063 6,823.96 | .0808 87,520.06 § .0241 31,520.22




BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

SECTION ONE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL
Bi_d Award Recommendation

Alternate ' PRIMARY : _ Secondary
" Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum
Douglass Distributing ~ Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX - Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, M! Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No ' HUB - No HUB - Yes _ HUB - No
. Plus f Plus/ ~Plus/ “Plus{ Plus /
. EST. 1 Minus’ Total Bid Minus Total Bid -Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION - USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Dift. Amount
No. 2 ULSD TxLED Diesel, : _ _
Tank Wagon Load (3,869 £ Plus Plus Plus Plus f Plus
15 igallons or less) 1,023,359 § .0800 81,868.72§ .1950 199,555.01f .0263 | 26,914.34 § .1743 178,371.47 § .0904 82,511.65
Red Dyed Diesel, Transport i
Load {7,500 galions or i Even Plus Plus Plus Plus
16 |rnore) 1 0000 _ 0.c0§ .0075 | 0.01% .0063 0.01 § 059 0.06 § .0036 0.01
Red-Dyed Diesel, Short : _
Transport Load (4,000 Plus | = - Plus Plus Plus 1 Plus
17 igallons to 7,489 gallons) - 1 § .0600 _ 0.068§ .0125° 0.01% .0163 0.02 § .0833 . DpoB§ .0179 0.02°
" iRed-Dyed Diesel, Tank ' _
Wagon Load (3,899 gallons Plus Pius Plus Plus “Plus _
18 lor less) 264,660 ¢ 0800 129,172.80% .1850 71,108.70§ .0263 9,590.56 § .1773 64,654.22 ¢ .0842 30,704.37
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID FOR SECTION ONE: 371,274.52 ' 412,083.74 134,271.26 B34,274.02 307,019.37




BiD NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

SECTION ONE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

Bid Award Recommendation

Alternate PRIMARY Secondary
Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum
Douglass Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, M Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Plus / Plus Plus f Plus / Plus /
EST. Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount
Normal Delivery Days After Recsipt of Order
(ARC) 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day
Provides Tank Monitoring Service? Yes No Yes Na Yes




BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

SECTION TWO: BIODIESEL
Bid Award Recommendation

PRIMARY Secondary Alternate
I;JOI_!g[a?S Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum
Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romuius, M Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Plus / Plus / Plus / Plus / Plus /
EST. Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount
Bio Diesel, B-10, Soy
Based per ASTM D 6751. .
Transport Load (7,500 Even Plus Plus _ Plus .
1 -{gallons or more) 1 L0000 ' 0.00{ .0050 0.01 § .0079 " 0.01 NO BID .0232 0.02
Bio Diesel, B-10 Soy Based
per ASTM D 6751. Short
Transport Load {4,000 __P]US ' Plus | Plus Plus _
2 |galions to 7,499 gallons) 1 %0600 - 0.06§ .0150 0.02 F .0179 0.02 _ NGO BID  § .0375 0.04
Bio Diesel, B-10 Soy Based
per ASTM D 8751. Tank ' : :
Wagon | oad, 3,999 gallons Plus 1B Plus Flus Plus
3 jorless 15,000 §.0800} ° 1,200.00§ .3550 5,325.00§ .0378 568.50 NO BID .1038 1,557.00




SECTION TWO: BIODIESEL

BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

Bid Award Recommendation

PRIMARY

Secondary Alternate
Po‘{gl"ﬁ‘?s Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Qil RKA Petroleum
Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, MI Dalias, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Pius { Plus { Plus / Plus / Plus /
EST. Minus Total Bid Minus Totat Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount Diff. Amount
Bio Diesel, B-20, Soy
Based per ASTM D 6751,
Transport Load (7,500 Even Plus Plus Plus
4 igalions or more) 762,265 1.0000 0.00§ .0050 3,811.33 3§ .0079 6,021.89 NO BiD .0232 17,684.55
Bio Diesel, B-20 Soy Based
per ASTM D 6751. Short
Transport Load (4,000 Plus Plus Plus Plus
5 igallens to 7,499 gallans) 1 .0600 0.06i 0150 0.02 § .0179 0.02 NO BID .0375 0.04
Bio Diesel, B-20 Soy Based
per ASTM D 6751, Tank
_ iWagon Load, 3,999 gallons Plus Plus Plus Plus
6 jorless 45000 §.0800 3,600.00f .3550 15,975.00 f .C379 1,705.50 NO BID 1038 4,671.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID FOR SECTION
TWO: 4,800.12 25.111.38 8,005.94 NO BID 23,912.65




SECTION TWO: BIODIESEL

BID NO. 2010-063, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

Bid Award Recommendation

 PRIMARY Secondary Alternate
I-JOL{QIEI?S Lykins Energy Martin Eagle Oil RKA Petroleum _
i Distributing Solutions Company Corporation TAC Energy
: Sherman, TX Milford, PA Denton, TX Romulus, M1 Dallas, TX
; HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
Plus / ' .. i Plus/ Plus f Plus f : Plus /
_ - EST. Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Total Bid Minus Tetal Bid Minus: Total Bid
ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE Diff, Amount Diff. Amount Diff., Amount Diff, Amount Diff. Amount
Normal Delivery Days After Receipt of Order . '
(ARO) 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day NO BID 1 Day
Provides Tank Monitoring Service? Yes No Yes NO BID. Yes




TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any County action that involves the adoption of a
regulation, policy, guideline, court resolution or order.

Project/Regulation Name:__ BiD No. 2014-063 — ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FUEL

County Department: PURCHASING
Contact Person: JACK BEACHAM. C.P.M., AP.P.
Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-1133

Type of TIA Performed: or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the

questions in Sections [l and [l below.
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[ Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy,
guideline, court resolution or order.
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Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist
should be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney’s
Office,

i Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the County action require a physical invasion, occupation or dedication of
real property? :
Yes No__ J
2. Does the County action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially or | |
temporarily?
Yes No J
If you answered yes to either question, go to Section lll. If you answered no to |

both, STOP HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.
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