
11/21/2012 10:01 AM 1 Jennifer Scruggs, Purchasing Technician

DATE :11/5/2012 TIME:  10:00 A.M.

Packaging Packaging
FUNGICIDES

1 Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. 200.00$       As Specified 10 gal. 1 gal. 145.00$       Myclobutanil
2 Daconil Zn 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 115.00$       As Specified 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 83.18$         Chlorothalonil
3 Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. 509.00$       As Specified 6 gal. 1 gal. No Bid -

HERBICIDES
1 Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 81.60$         Prosedge 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles No Bid -
2 Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. 2,740.00$   As Specified 20 gal. 10 gal. 198.67$       T-Nex
3 Revolver 30 qts. 87 oz. 540.00$       As Specified 30 qts. 1 qt. No Bid -
4 Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. 89.50$         Evade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. 103.83$       Prodiamine 4L
5 Monument 1500 grams 25 gram box 215.00$       As Specified 1500 grams 25 gram box No Bid -
6 Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum 435.00$       Ranger Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum 15.53$         Glyphosate
7 Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 525.00$       As Specified 50 gal. 2.5 gal. No Bid -
8 Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 119.88$       As Specified 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 139.18$       Oryzalin
9 Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 1.25 gal 38.00$         Pin-Dee 100 gal. 2.5 gal. No Bid -

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 10oz. Btls 10 oz. bottle 52.25$         As Specified 20 10oz. Btls 10 oz. bottle No Bid -

2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. 140.00$       As Specified 8 quarts Qt. No Bid -
3 Advion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag 129.00$       As Specified 36# 12# bag No Bid -
4 Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag 225.00$       As Specified 50# 25# bag No Bid -

OTHER
1 K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. 15.75$         As Specified 10 ton 50lb. No Bid -
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 30 gal. 1,380.00$   Respond 3 165 gal. 55 gal. 81.15$         Cascade Plus

3
15-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated 
Irn.+2% Mn 2000 gal.

Bulk or cubes 
250 gal min. 6.40$           As Specified 2000 gal.

Bulk or cubes 
275 gal min. No Bid -

4 Houactinite fwy grade 100 tons
End dump 
truck 175.00$       As Specified 100 tons

End dump 
truck No Bid -

Est. Qty Bidder's Product Est. Qty Bid Price

CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
             "ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR  FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER:  003-13
Agrium Advanced Technologies Ameriturf

Bidder's Product Bid Price



11/21/2012 10:01 AM 2 Jennifer Scruggs, Purchasing Technician

DATE :11/5/2012 TIME:  10:00 A.M.

Packaging Packaging
FUNGICIDES

1 Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. 182.95$       Eagle 2EW 10 gal. 1 gal. 182.00$       As Specified
2 Daconil Zn 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 116.75$       Agency 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 115.00$       As Specified
3 Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. 509.00$       Agency 6 gal. 1 gal. 502.00$       As Specified

HERBICIDES
1 Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 62.50$         As Specified 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 90.00$         As Specified
2 Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. 2,740.00$   Agency 20 gal. 10 gal. 2,740.00$   As Specified
3 Revolver 30 qts. 1 qt. 199.95$       As Specified 30 qts. 1 qt. 220.00$       As Specified
4 Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. 137.00$       Agency 50 gal. 1 gal. 137.00$       As Specified
5 Monument 1500 grams 25 gram box 215.00$       Agency 1500 grams 25 gram box 240.00$       As Specified
6 Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum No Bid - 90 gal. 30 gal. drum 600.00$       As Specified
7 Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 509.99$       As Specified 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 475.00$       As Specified
8 Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 110.00$       As Specified 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 99.00$         As Specified
9 Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. 70.65$         As Specified 100 gal. 2.5 gal. 63.00$         Pin-Dee

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 10oz. Btls 10 oz. bottle 51.87$         As Specified 20 10oz. Btls 10 oz. bottle 58.00$         As Specified
2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. 126.49$       As Specified 8 quarts Qt. 125.00$       As Specified
3 Advion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag 114.89$       As Specified 36# 12# bag 122.00$       As Specified
4 Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag 204.30$       Discontinued 50# 25# bag 225.00$       As Specified

OTHER
1 K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. 12.78$         As Specified 10 ton 50lb. 12.75$         As Specified
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. 2,813.25$   Aqua Aid 165 gal. 55 gal. 1,925.00$   Soaker Plus

3
15-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated 
Irn.+2% Mn 2000 gal.

Bulk or cubes 
275 gal min. 6.6798$       As Specified 2000 gal.

Bulk or cubes 
275 gal min. 10.00$         

 Turf Mag 10-0-0 
4% fe 2%mg 

4 Houactinite fwy grade 100 tons
End dump 
truck 174.95$       As Specified 100 tons

End dump 
truck 180.00$       As Specified

BWI Companies, Inc. Helena Chemical Company

Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product 

             "ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR  FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"
BID NUMBER:  003-13

CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION



11/21/2012 10:01 AM 3 Jennifer Scruggs, Purchasing Technician

DATE :11/5/2012 TIME:  10:00 A.M.

Packaging
FUNGICIDES

1 Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. 185.69$       As Specified
2 Daconil Zn 15 gal. 2.5 gal. 116.75$       Agency
3 Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. 509.00$       Agency

HERBICIDES
1 Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles 93.26$         As Specified
2 Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. 2,740.00$   Agency
3 Revolver 30 qts. 1 qt. 202.25$       As Specified
4 Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. 137.00$       Agency
5 Monument 1500 grams 25 gram box 215.00$       Agency
6 Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum 516.00$       As Specified
7 Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 500.75$       As Specified
8 Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. 141.10$       As Specified
9 Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. 78.65$         Pedulum 3.3EC

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 10oz. Btls 10 oz. bottle 55.70$         As Specified
2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. 124.69$       Scimitar
3 Advion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag 114.36$       As Specified
4 Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag 224.25$       As Specified

OTHER
1 K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. 16.50$         As Specified
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. 3,737.80$   As Specified

3
15-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated 
Irn.+2% Mn 2000 gal.

Bulk or cubes 
275 gal min. No Bid -

4 Houactinite fwy grade 100 tons
End dump 
truck No Bid -

Winfield

Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product 

CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
             "ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR  FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER:  003-13
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