CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION

"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 011-11 DATE: 10/17/2011 TIME: 10:00 A.M.
Helena Chemical Company John Deere Landscapes
Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1]Eagle WP 50 Ibs. $ 185.00 Eagle20EW 50 Ibs. $ - As Specified
2|Daconil Zn 20 gal. $ 115.00 As Specified 20 gal. $ 115.00 Agency
3|Heritage 4L 12 gal. $ 495.00 As Specified 12 gal. $ 502.00 Agency
HERBICIDES
1]Sedge Hammer 30 bottles $ 85.00 As Specified 30 bottles $ 89.03 As Specified
2]Primo Link Pak 20 gal. $ 2,700.00 As Specified 20 gal. $ 2,740.00 Agency
3|Revolver 30 gts. $ 200.00 As Specified 10 gal. $ 306.48 As Specified
4|Barricade 4L 50 gal. $ 135.00 As Specified 50 gal. $ 142.00 As Specified
5 1500 grams | $ 215.00 As Specified 1500 grams | $ 240.00 Agency
6]Monument / Roundup Pro 90 gal. $ 990.00 As Specified 90 gal. $ 473.05 Prosecutor Pro
7]Dimension Ultra 100 Ibs. $ 105.00 As Specified 100 Ibs. $ 145.58 As Specified
8]Surflan 90 wdg 100 Ibs. $ 38.00 Surflan AS-Liquid  J100 Ibs. $ - No Bid
9]Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. $ 65.00 As Specified 100 gal. $ 85.17 As Specified
INSECTICIDES
1]Provant 20100z.Btls | $ 50.00 As Specified 5 cases $ 70.49 As Specified
2]Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts $ 125.00 Scimitar 8 quarts $ 186.95 Scimitar GC
3]Distance Fire Ant 50# $ 174.75 As Specified 50# $ 247.48 As Specified
4|Award Fire Ant 50# $ 211.00 As Specified 50# $ 304.56 As Specified
OTHER

1|Naiad Super Pellets 12 pellets $ - No Bid 12 pellets $ - No Bid
2] TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. $ - No Bid 165 gal. $ 1,312.91 Lesco
3]Emerald Isle CPR 120 gal. $ - No Bid 120 gal. $ 120.78 | Micro Mix Chelated
4|Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar N 100 gal. $ - No Bid 100 gal. $ - No Bid
5]Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar K 50 gal. $ - No Bid 50 gal. $ - No Bid
6|Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar Mn 50 gal. $ - No Bid 50 gal. $ 23.84 Manganese

15-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated
7]Ir.+2% Mn 2000 gal. $ 5.79 Turf Nectar 2000 gal. $ 31.61 Ferromec

Emerald Isle Fairway 30-0-0
g|w/seaplant extract 110 gal. $ - No Bid 110 gal. $ 375.54 Green Flo

11/3/2011 4:46 PM

Jennifer Scruggs, Purchasing Technician



CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 011-11 DATE: 10/17/2011 TIME: 10:00 A.M.
Winfield Solutions Agrium Advanced Technologies
Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1]Eagle WP 50 Ibs. $ 174.72 As Specified 50 Ibs. $ 164.00 Eagle 20EW
2]Daconil Zn 20 gal. $ 115.00 Agency 20 gal. $ 115.00 Agency
3|Heritage 4L 12 gal. $ 502.00 Agency 12 gal. $ 502.00 Agency
HERBICIDES
1]Sedge Hammer 30 bottles $ 93.26 As Specified 30 bottles $ 58.00 Pro Sedge
2]Primo Link Pak 20 gal. $ 2,740.00 Agency 20 gal. $ 2,740.00 Agency
3|Revolver 30 gts. $ 202.25 As Specified 10 gal. $ 170.00 As Specified
4|Barricade 4L 50 gal. $ 142.00 Link Pak 50 gal. $ 137.00 Agency
5 1500 grams | $ 240.00 As Specified 1500 grams | $ 215.00 Agency
6|Monument Roundup Pro 90 gal. $ 494.40 Cornerstone Plus |90 gal. $ 448.20 Kleen-Up Pro
7|Dimension Ultra 100 Ibs. $ 106.32 As Specified 100 Ibs. $ 86.49 As Specified
8| Surflan 90 wdg 100 Ibs. $ - No Bid 100 Ibs. $ 119.50 As Specified
9]Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. $ 76.00 As Specified 100 gal. $ 68.49 As Specified
INSECTICIDES
1]Provant 20 bottles $ 52.70 As Specified 5 cases $ 56.50 As Specified
2|Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts $ 124.69 As Specified 8 quarts $ 86.89 Cyonora
3]Distance Fire Ant 50# $ 167.25 As Specified 50# $ 230.00 Advion
4|Award Fire Ant 50# $ 210.25 As Specified 50# $ 192.49 As Specified
OTHER
1]Naiad Super Pellets 12 pellets $ 875.00 As Specified 12 pellets $ - No Bid
2] TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. $ 3,060.00 As Specified 165 gal. $ 2,336.40 Respond 3
3|Emerald Isle CPR 120 gal. $ 668.00 As Specified 120 gal. $ - No Bid
4|Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar N 100 gal. $ 98.00 As Specified 100 gal. $ 58.75 Sirins
5|Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar K 50 gal. $ 120.00 As Specified 50 gal. $ 45.00 K-Acetate
6|Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar Mn 50 gal. $ 120.00 As Specified 50 gal. $ - No Bid
15-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated
7]Irn.+2% Mn 2000 gal. $ 7.50 As Specified 2000 gal. $ 6.15 Featere AC
Emerald Isle Fairway 30-0-0
g|w/seaplant extract 110 gal. $ 985.00 As Specified 110 gal. $ 1,071.95 Spica

11/3/2011 4:46 PM

Jennifer Scruggs, Purchasing Technician
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