
CALS"

Bid PriceEst. Qty

Lesco Incorporated UAP
Bidder's 
Product Bidder's Product Bid PriceEst. Qty

CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
             "ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR  FERTILIZER AND CHEMI

BID NUMBER:  010-09 DATE: 8/10/2009 TIME: 10:00 A.M.
Estes Incorporated Helena Chemical Company

Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product Est. Qty Bid Price Bidder's Product 
FUNGICIDES

1 Eagle WP 50 lbs. $ 255       .50 Per 1 Gallon 50 lbs. No Bid - 50 lbs. No Bid - 50 lbs. 264.45$       Gallon
2 Daconil Zn 20 gal. $ 120       .75 Agency 20 gal. 120.7$       5 As specified 20 gal. 120.75$     As specified 20 gal. 120.75$       Agency
3 Heritage 4L 12 gal. $ 652       .80 Agency 12 gal. 652.8$       0 As specified 12 gal. 652.80$     As specified 12 gal. 652.80$       Agency

HERBICIDES
1 Sedge Hammer 4 cases $ 78         .81 As specified 4 cases 82.0$         0 As specified 4 cases 100.53$     #088466 4 cases 83.00$         As specified
2 Primo Link Pak 20 gal. $ 3,    203.00 Agency 20 gal. 320.3$       0 As specified 20 gal. 3,203.00$  As Specified 20 gal. 305.15$       Agency
3 Revolver 10 gal. $ 178       .00 As specified 10 gal. 180.0$       0 As specified 10 gal. 240.77$     As Specified 10 gal. 175.50$       As specified
4 Barricade 4L 40 gal. $ 213       .13 As specified 40 gal. 223.9$       6 As specified 40 gal. 295.12$     As Specified 40 gal. 199.50$       Agency
5 Roundup Pro 90 gal. $ 1,    375.00 Pro-Concentrate 90 gal. 1,240.0$    0 As specified 90 gal. 1,020.51$  Prosecutor Pro 90 gal. 920.00$       Kleen-Up Pro
6 Dimension Ultra 100 lbs. $ 103       .95 As specified 100 lbs. 60.5$         0 As specified 100 lbs. 138.21$     As Specified 100 lbs. 546.45$       As specified
7 Surflan 90 wdg 100 lbs. $ 133       .76 Oryzalin Pro 100 lbs. No Bid - 100 lbs. No Bid - 100 lbs. 118.50$       Surflan 4L
8 Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. $ 89         .47 As specified 100 gal. 95.0$         0 Pendulum 100 gal. 180.85$     Pre-M E.C. 100 gal. 87.90$         As specified
9 Monument 500 grams $ 235       .00 Agency 500 grams 235.0$       0 As specified 500 grams 235.00$     As Specified 500 grams 235.00$       Agency

INSECTICIDES
1 Provant 20 bottles $ 51         .15 As specified 5 cases 52.2$         5 As specified 5 cases 58.94$        As specified 5 cases 46.40$         As Specified

2 Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts $ 123       .95 As specified 8 quarts 125.0$       0 Sciniton GC 8 quarts 165.01$     Scimitar 8 quarts 119.99$       Scimitar GC
3 Distance Fire Ant 50# $ 171       .50 As specified 50# 165.0$       0 As specified 50# 210.00$     As specified 50# 120.00$       Advion Bait
4 Award 50# $ 204       .95 As specified 50# 212.5$       0 As specified 50# 275.50$     As specified 50# 189.95$       As Specified

OTHER
1 Naiad Super Pellets 12 pellets $ 925       .00 As specified 12 pellets No Bid - 12 pellets No Bid - 12 pellets No Bid -
2 TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. $ 3,    285.00 As specified 165 gal. 1,430.0$    0 Soaker 165 gal. No Bid - 165 gal. 112.50$       Respond 3
3 Emerald Isle CPR 120 gal. $ 711       .00 As specified 120 gal. No Bid - 120 gal. No Bid - 120 gal. 530.00$       Alphanova
4 Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar N 100 gal. $ 102       .50 As specified 100 gal. 16.0$         0 CN-9 32-0-0 100 gal. No Bid - 100 gal. 8.75$           Sirius:17-5-11
5 Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar K 50 gal. $ 126       .00 As specified 50 gal. 62.0$         0 Elemax K 50 gal. No Bid - 50 gal. 62.50$         Rigel:5-0-20
6 Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar Mn 50 gal. $ 126       .00 As specified 50 gal. 140.0$       0 Elemax MN 50 gal. No Bid - 50 gal. 51.60$         Blackjack MN

7
15-0-0 w/6%--100% C
Irn.+2% Mn

healated 
2000 gal. $ 2,    015.00 As specified 2000 gal. 6.0$           0 Elemax Turf Nectar 2000 gal. 6.92$          12-0-0 2000 gal. 6.25$           Feature AC

8
Emerald Isle Fairway 3
w/seaplant extract

0-0-0 
110 gal. $ 1,    135.00 As specified 110 gal. 660.0$       0 Coron 110 gal. No Bid - 110 gal. 625.00$       UAN 32-0-0

9/4/2009 9:40 AM 1 Mike Lowry, Purchasing Manager
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