CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION

"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 009-08 DATE: 7/16/2008 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
BWI COMPANIES INC. UNIVAR USA HELENA CHEMICAL CO. ESTES INC. UAP JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's
Est. Qty Bid Price Product Est. Qty Bid Price Product Est. Qty Bid Price Product Est. Qty Bid Price Product Est. Qty Bid Price Product Est. Qty Bid Price Product
FUNGICIDES
1]Eagle WP 50 Ibs. NO BID - 50 Ibs. NO BID - 50 Ibs. $ 270.00 | As Specified |50 Ibs. $ 50.39 Hoist 50 Ibs. $ 254.00 Eagle 50 Ibs. $ 46.84 Hoist
#SY31214
3]Daconil Zn 20 gal. $ 132.50 Syngenta 20 gal. NO BID - 20 gal. $ 132.50 | As Specified ]20 gal. $ 132.50 Agency 20 gal. $ 132.50 Agency 20 gal. $ 106.60 Echo ZN
#SY21327
5]Heritage 4L 12 gal. $  640.00 Syngenta |12 gal. NO BID - 12 gal. $ 640.00 | As Specified |12 gal. $  640.00 Agency 12 gal. $ 640.00 Agency 12 gal. $ 1,978.46 | Disarm 480SC
HERBICIDES
#GW35720
1]Sedge Hammer 4 cases $ 81.00 Golan 4 cases NO BID - 4 cases $ 80.00 | As Specified ]4 cases $ 78.83 | As Specified |4 cases $ 78.90 | As Specified |4 cases $ 118.00 | As Specified
#SY22535
3|Primo Link Pak 20 gal. $ 3,690.00 Syngenta |20 gal. NO BID - 20 gal. $ 3,690.00 | As Specified ]20 gal. $ 3,690.00 Agency 20 gal. $ 3,690.00 Agency 20 gal. $ 1,930.00 |Lesco Regimax
#BYT4919318
4]Revolver 10 gal. $ 170.00 Bayer 10 gal. NO BID - 10 gal. $ 185.00 | As Specified |10 gal. $ 169.73 | As Specified |10 gal. $ 175.00 | As Specified |10 gal. $ 235.90 | As Specified
#SY30351
5|Barricade 4L 40 gal. $ 190.40 Syngenta |40 gal. NO BID - 40 gal. $ 225.00 | As Specified ]40 gal. $  215.79 | As Specified ]40 gal. $ 208.00 | As Specified 40 gal. NO BID -
#SY19560
6]Monument 500 grams | $  228.00 Syngenta  |500 grams NO BID - 500 grams | $ 228.00 | As Specified 500 grams [ $ 228.00 Agency 500grams | $ 228.00 Agency 500 grams | $ 95.60 Certainty
CEesco
7]Roundup Pro 90 gal. NO BID - 90 gal. NO BID - 90 gal. NO BID - 90 gal. $ 1,198.00 | GlyFos-X-tra |90 gal. $ 1,170.00 Monsanto 90 gal. $ 1,140.00 Prosecutor
8]Dimension Ultra 100 Ibs. NO BID - 100 Ibs. NO BID - 100 Ibs. $ 135.00 | As Specified ]100 Ibs. $ 125.43 | As Specified ]100 Ibs. $ 128.00 | As Specified ]100 Ibs. $ 319.42 Lifeguard
9]Surflan 90 wdg 100 Ibs. NO BID - 100 Ibs. NO BID - 100 Ibs. NO BID - 100 Ibs. $ 198.98 | As Specified ]100 Ibs. $ 132.00 | AsT&O-UPI ]100 Ibs. NO BID -
#AM2470040
10]Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. $ 85.05 BASF 100 gal. NO BID - 100 gal. $  95.00 | As Specified ]100 gal. $ 87.97 | As Specified |100 gal. $ 89.00 BASF 100 gal. $ 102.62 [ Lesco Pre-M
INSECTICIDES
1]Provant 20/10 oz. NO BID - 5 cases NO BID - 5 cases $ 55.00 | As Specified |5 cases $ 55.97 | As Specified |5 cases $ 44.45 | As Specified |5 cases $ 53.30 | As Specified
#SYN3419RR
2]Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts $ 114.21 Syngenta |8 quarts NO BID - 8 quarts $ 125.00 | As Specified |8 quarts $ 124.94 | As Specified |8 quarts $ 113.00 | Scimitar GC |8 quarts $ 159.15 | As Specified
#0ADistance2
3|Distance Fire Ant 50# $ 145.31 5 50# $ 251.25 | As Specified |50# $ 162.50 | As Specified |50# $ 175.88 | As Specified |50# $ 114.00 Advion 50# $ 192.00 [ As Specified
4]Award Fire Ant 50# NO BID - 50# $ 278.25 | As Specified |50# $ 187.50 | As Specified |50# $ 188.17 | As Specified |50# $ 181.25 | As Specified |50# $ 169.34 [ As Specified
OTHER
1|Naiad Super Pellets 12 pellets NO BID - 12 pellets NO BID - 12 pellets NO BID - 12 pellets $ 825.00 | As Specified |12 pellets NO BID - 12 pellets $ 152.77 LESCO
#AQ17 Soaker Plus 30
2| TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. $ 971.19 | Aquatrols ]165 gal. NO BID - 165 gal. $ 1,140.00 gal 165 gal. $ 2,785.00 | As Specified ]165 gal. $ 3,269.00 Neptune 165 gal. $ 1,156.65 LESCO
3]Emerald Isle CPR 120 gal. NO BID - 120 gal. NO BID - 120 gal. NO BID - 120 gal. $ 555.50 | As Specified ]120 gal. NO BID - 120 gal. $ 120.00 [ Progressive
4]Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar N 100 gal. NO BID - 100 gal. NO BID - 100 gal. $  50.00 | Helena 19-1-6 ]100 gal. $ 81.50 | As Specified |100 gal. NO BID - 100 gal. $ 42.00 LESCO
5]Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar K 50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. $  60.00 | Elemax K-Leat |50 gal. $ 107.00 | As Specified |50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. $ 32.65 LESCO
6]Emerald Isle Nutrirational Foliar Mn |50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. $ 107.00 | As Specified |50 gal. NO BID - 50 gal. $ 30.70 LESCO
15-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated
7]Irn.+2% Mn 2000 gal. NO BID - 2000 gal. NO BID - 2000 gal. $ 9.50 | Turf Nectar AC ]2000 gal. $ 6.78 | Mor-Green |2000 gal. $ 4.35 Feature AC  ]2000 gal. $ 5.45 LESCO
Emerald Isle Fairway 30-0-0 32-0-0/Hydra-
8|w/seaplant extract 110 gal. NO BID - 110 gal. NO BID - 110 gal. $ 190.00 Hume 110 gal. $  639.50 | As Specified |110 gal. NO BID - 110 gal. $ 34231 LESCO




BID NUMBER: 009-08

Not awarding items below do to unstable granular fertilizer market and prices only good for maximum of 30 days

DATE:

7/16/2008

TIME:

2:00 P.M.

BWI COMPANIES, INC.

UNIVAR USA

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.

ESTES INC.

UAP

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

Est. Qty

Bid Price

Bidder's
Product

Est. Qty

Bid Price

Bidder's
Product

Est. Qty

Bid Price

Bidder's
Product

Est. Qty

Bid Price

Bidder's
Product

Est. Qty

Bid Price

Bidder's
Product

Est. Qty

Bid Price

Bidder's
Product

SACK FERTILIZER

ITEM 1:

Pendimethalin 20-3-4+.86% ai
Minimum 20%PSCU, Estimated
purchase is 20 tons, Must be
approved formulator based BASF,
Max SGN 200. Packaging will be in
50# bags.

State SGN Rating/State Analysys
and Al

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

$

17.78

BCF

50# Bag

$ 17.70

Turf Care
Supply

50#Bag | $

28.60

LESCO

200/2-3-4 20%PSCU .86% Pendi

200/21-2-7 .86% Pendulum & 40%PSCU

200/Pre-M 0.867 19-3-7 30%PPSCU

N

ITEM 2:

Anderson's Dimension 18-3-12
0.164% ai or equal. Must be
approved formulator by Dow Agro.
25%PSCU, Packaging will be 50#
bags, Estimated purchase is 20 tons.
Max SGN 150.

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

$28.94

'he Anderson'y

50# Bag

$28.50

Turf Care
Supply

50# Bag

$45.95

LESCO

State SGN Rating/State Analysys
and Al

150/18-3-12 25% PSCU 0

.164% Dimen.

150/20-4

-10 0.22 Dimen.&40%PSCU

150/Dimen. 0.217 18-0-18m 50%PPSCU

(%)

ITEM 3:

Urea 46-0-0, Water Soluable-Food
Grade--Prilled suitable for spraying.
Max SGN 180. Packaging size will be
50# bags.

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

$

19.63

50# Bag

$ 24.50

50#Bag | $

24.52

LESCO

State SGN Rating:

180

200

180

ITEM 4:

28-3-10 50%PSCU, Estimated
purchase is 20 tons, Packaging will
be 50# bags. Max SGN 200.

State SGN Rating/State PSCU%:

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

NO BID

50# Bag

$20.40

50# Bag

$23.50

50# Bag

$31.62

LESCO

200/28-3-10 50%PSCU

200/ 50 & 3%FE

200/28-3-10 4.5Fe 50%PSCU

BULK FERTILIZER

[N

ITEM 1.

Houactinite -
200 tons.

Estimated purchase is

Ton

NO BID

Ton

NO BID

Ton

NO BID

Ton

$

55.40

Waco-Actinite

Ton

$ 80.00

Ton

NO BID




Vendor

BWI

Estes, Inc.

UAP

John Deere

2008 Parks and Golf Course Plant Protectants and Fertilizer Bid

Bid #009-08
Bid Iltem

Pendimethalin (liquid)
Distance fire ant
Barricade 4L
VENDOR TOTAL:

Sedge Hammer

Revolver

Dimension Ultra

Surflan 90 wdg

Naiad Super Pellets

Tricure

Emerald Isle CPR

Emerald Isle Foliar N

Emerald Isle Foliar K

Emerald Isle Foliar Mn

Emerald Isle Fwy 30-0-0
VENDOR TOTAL:

eagle EW
Daconil ZN
Heritage 4L
Primo link pack
Monument
Round Up Pro
15-0-0 wb%Fe
Provant
Battle GC
VENDOR TOTAL:

Award Fire Ant

Total

*# B B P

L R AR IR - A - B o -

LR R R AR R - -

Est. Quantity $ Amount

8,505.00
290.62
7,616.00
16,411.62

3,153.20
6,789.20
6,271.50
3,979.60
1,650.00
8,355.00
4,444.00
3,260.00
2,140.00
2,140.00
1,279.00
43,461.50

5,080.00
1,060.00
7,680.00
7,380.00
4,560.00
2,340.00
8,700.00
2,222.50

904.00
$82,772

$338.68

142,983.80



	Sheet1
	Sheet2

